REPORT OF THE SUBJECT COMMITTEE
ON
THE GURUVAYOOR DEVASWOM (AMENDMENT) BILL, 2025
AND
THE BILL AS REPORTED BY THE SUBJECT COMMITTEE

Presented on 29" September, 2025

©
Kerala Legislature Secretariat
2025

KERALA NIYAMASABHA PRINTING PRESS.



REPORT OF THE SUBJECT COMMITTEE

ON
THE GURUVAYOOR DEVASWOM (AMENDMENT) BILL, 2025

AND
THE BILL AS REPORTED BY THE SUBJECT COMMITTEE

Presented on 29" September, 2025

974/2025.



CONTENTS

Composition of the Committee
Report of the Subject Committee
Appendix I: Dissent Note

Appendix II : Bill as reported by the Subject Committee

Page



SUBJECT COMMITTEE II
(LAND REVENUE AND DEVASWOM)
(2023-2026)

Composition
Chairperson :

Shri K. Rajan,

Minister for Revenue and Housing.

Ex-Officio Member:

Shri V. N. Vasavan,
Minister for Ports, Co-operation and Devaswoms.
Members:

Shri Ahammad Devarkovil
DR. N. Jayaraj

Shri N. A. Nellikkunnu
Shri K. D. Prasenan

Shri P. T. A. Rahim

Shri M. Rajagopalan

Shri Saneeshkumar Joseph

Shri P. V. Sreenijin

Legislature Secretariat :
DR. N. Krishna Kumar, Secretary
Smt. Sheeba Varghese, Joint Secretary

Shri Anil Kumar B., Deputy Secretary
Shri Mohanan O., Under Secretary



THE GURUVAYOOR DEVASWOM (AMENDMENT)
BILL, 2025

(Report of the Subject Committee)

The Guruvayoor Devaswom (Amendment) Bill, 2025 was referred to
Subject Committee II (Land Revenue and Devaswom). Subject Committee 1T
considered the Bill clause by clause and now submits this report with the Bill
as reported by the Subject Committee annexed thereto.

2. The Guruvayoor Devaswom (Amendment) Bill, 2025 was published as
a Gazette Extraordinary dated 2-9-2025. The Bill was introduced in the
Assembly on 17" September, 2025 and was referred to the Subject Committee I

on the same day.

3. The Committee considered the Bill clause by clause at its meeting held
on 24" September 2025. The Committee recommends to adopt the Bill with the

following modifications:—
Clause 1
1) Clause 1(2) shall be recast as follows:
“Save as otherwise provided in this Act,—

(i) Section 2 shall deemed to come into force on 1* day of January,
2025;

(ii) the remaining sections shall come into force at once.”.
Clause 2
2) In Section 9, proposed to be substituted in the principal Act by clause 2,—
(i) the word “published” shall be deleted;
(ii) the words “such Chairman and members” shall be deleted,;

(iii) after the words “travelling allowance”, for the word “or” the
word “and” shall be substituted.

974/2025.



3) The following proviso shall be added to Section 9, proposed to be
substituted in the principal Act by clause 2, namely :—

“Provided that a member nominated as per Section 4(1)(d) shall not be
entitled to receive honorarium.”.

4. All other changes are either verbal or consequential.

5. The dissent note is appended.

Thiruvananthapuram, K. RAJAN,

29™ September, 2025. Chairperson,
Subject Committee II.



APPENDIX I
aflewommMa30laf

L@@  e3aIavlo  2eMeEloty’ &Rl HalWAROMo  BROWEBBUILE
806meooleaje MGy’ anlme M@E:MNM@IMo; BoeMeFlow’” @olglges 2
MEI8MEBBUIBNISWIG3  OMBIGAN  MSeRsWleel  ©Igualld:  aleln)dhud
eMAISM@IM” GRAIMIEIYGAEH” §aILINNGEHINJIN D& @RYIVIEOMIGE Mlawoe
GRMIGIMIVI00  (@GalIW] 2WAEM@IMo;  HIIGIYHS  HONHNIUYBBDo
@MIGIMIVI00 (@BalW@ &5O@3 aflel UGBIMDAOW R0NNAUNRSHES0 BRYBOTMBBESBI
HlaUIMQOS  BRMAD]T  &SIO®  ANTIHBAUIEMI  aleMWHISODAIIEMNI 2Q
AlwE1@ EEMPWIMHISADANEMI 2 IdSIE] af)aA0M” MALNO3 AYAIMIN e2IQYIgSsO.

1978-081 ©®mONQE €BQITVIe @R @I G@RYOS 9 @RWEBBIM’
296m2Zlot)” H221010e|88®. MGG EYQEALIHD MVoTVOIM (r)o_lmﬁoa@“ emoailemg’
921, @P®IG 80003 210UMBN@OS DMWY B0IW algld:20®] alleovonilad
MBS BRoWOJAIEM”. GADEAIB TuLldo GRoWEBBIEM”. MVIF®I1R S, aaflewal
DEIOAD  HIVMAUAB, SO af)dy  BablGauyd @RV @Y Vsl 9
@RoUEBRBIAM OBBD) .

R10MEPIBOS @@INIWIWI® @RoWOERIM” E3AUTVIOMI@ Mo af)Lld
@RMZLILERGBo  VMIBOJo M@SHM@INI@  aVIglow)” alay,  B26mMeE001Wo
ag)alal GRMAIBlSSIMN®INA VWD o alBlEUIWIHNOESMNEMIM”.  2IEMeTow)’
So1gl  @RowEBEIW]  MWalEneq|gINAIGIEE  EH@-TVoMNIM  MVAHHIE,
Do ND@EAILID MUNIaIMeBBRE1E8 Mo Aflealaj0ld ©Udna]3MOAIN; 1T @RAIGHN”
Hal03aHM ERYMLLINEEW LIS1SSM@IMIT3, CALIOT @IRYIYZ:EIERUIHE" BROIMRHIUO
220118918l a)M  AILAIND &S] DUBHQIFEOMEMEME”.  GRYIDLLILEERUD
@RMAIZIABM®INS8 AL OINNGEIOR!  AYSIDEBOAI alBla0GIEHHMBMIMOIG3
nilgflecmos’ ollewolq | COaIDqIZ@DAD.

VM laU @203 GEROMVan (83a])
af)M. af). dMENSRAD” (83a])

974/2025.



APPENDIX -II
THE GURUVAYOOR DEVASWOM (AMENDMENT) BILL, 2025
(As reported by the Subject Committee)

[The words underlined/sidelined indicate the modifications suggested by the Committee.

Omissions are indicated by asterisks.]
A
BILL
further to amend the Guruvayoor Devaswom Act, 1978.

Preamble.—WHEREAS, it is expedient further to amend the Guruvayoor
Devaswom Act, 1978 (14 of 1978) for the purposes hereinafter appearing;

BE it enacted in the Seventy- sixth Year of the Republic of India as follows:—

1. Short title and commencement.—(1) This Act may be called the
Guruvayoor Devaswom (Amendment) Act, 2025.

(2) Save as otherwise provided in this Act,—
(i) Section 2 shall deemed to come into force on 1* day of January, 2025;
(ii) the remaining sections shall come into force at once.

2. Amendment of section 9.—In the Guruvayoor Devaswom Act, 1978 (14 of
1978), (hereinafter referred to as the principal Act), for section 9, the following

section shall be substituted, namely: —

“9. Remuneration of the Chairman and members.—The Chairman and
members of the Committee shall be entitled to receive per mensem, such honoraria
and sitting fees, as may be fixed by the Government from time to time, by
notification [***] in the Official Gazette and [***] shall also be entitled to receive

such travelling allowance and daily allowances, if any, as may be prescribed:

Provided that a member nominated as per Section 4(1)(d) shall not be

entitled to receive honorarium.”



3. Amendment of section 11.—In sub-section (1) of section 11 of the
principal Act, for the words “five thousand rupees”, the words “fifty thousand
rupees” shall be substituted.

4. Amendment of section 17.—In sub-section (3) of section 17 of the principal
Act, for the words “five thousand rupees”, the words “fifty thousand rupees” shall
be substituted.

Kerala Legislature Secretariat, DR. N. KRISHNA KUMAR,
Thiruvananthapuram, Secretary.
29™ September, 2025.



