15 -2 eHeE Mloadue

9 -90 aqVEIASBMo

MEYUE@)_allaMo EOLIOT B.a10BYe Mo. 340

(o)

(enf)

08-08-2023 - @ aQaisky’

0&Sls Mdaoem alge

GaloBYo

Wl es.all myeaay

2022-7 guontto XZIS MIBaRIEM 2I15OWIEE M0G0

mmﬂ%csnao; allteBIsw. LIRYAIERICHD;

e3ls Mdadem ealddly aidleamaitess ojclw
MSalSlGeRud, Maal@lW] aganlal

9136 OsSQSs QlltoBEIUde AIRINILHIEAD;

(o)

(enf)

DO @0

Wl ago.6nil @ocmaa

(®E3U0 MVIWEEEMe, 0OV Qldsa] AQD)

o6me. 2022-m cwao G.O(P)No. 9/2023/LSGD
dated 17/1/2023 @J#9®0 eH08 gmlmilajoaid]
edSls mldmosm algeanglaje G.O(P) No.
10/2023/LSGD dated 17/1/2023 (J®00@0 ¢608
AleIOQOD OBSIS MIBEN06eM 2lSEEREIRj CRANMI
m@m’]@’lgmﬁ saI@ mldamaemo cmom.law'l_gdgg
CRANDIWIOT RT3 DOMEAYEBUB (@I MrInldd
QIgSs®. (2OMEABEES ald@a] @OMENITW.

1, 2 e©fl cadomoigere:)

2019-68! ee8 alerio@oy galailajoaldl]

OB SISMIBAROEM 2ISEERSE AUITLOB:S0
a102il9Jeod:06ME’ @R QAUDIROW EOEUM:UD MablD0
@REAISH TUada]lalo@d 15 dlaimvosiress]od
MG S0 @OMAT N EBHERI MRMVIEBHEWI
621GQ) NI, @RMRAD] MBI BIEBHHCWI
MRVl IDIEERHEWI 6).21QPICB @REAIBUMHENR
elal®maow @oealeHMlcm®md &oemailod
ONBROMODFEHIB ENUOWITVAT0 15
dlairvomlesslod &0emaulad @l@adMoe
LIRIBHIOD QUM alddo @RMADT] 2IEl O]
&6emMEn0ss] (Deemed Permit) @ogaletom’

MIB2n26Moe ®SEBROQYIMN@IE).

OB SIS MIBEREMIMAT] &S @I
MY@IEYDISBMIM eauenel 28/6/2021-ee!
G.O(Ms) No. 121/2021/LSGD eomeal @&
munemessirl 28/6/2021-ee1 G.O(Ms) No.
120/2021/LSGD pomeal (@)@0@0
alim@@DHglaj ¢ald Slay allsonomla)ss
mldemoemeanud e (300 aLdl. @oey @ryed:
allmJidepassm. 7 digclsd @ie DwegssD.,
H@BMRISHUB UOEQYESD® AW QDT

m’k%mmomecrago, 200 2Ldlgolad @oee

1of2



(o)

edgls MIBan2em ealdaly’ ® e EemnEnIEsmMm
@OMEEMWEBRUE, MILA Aod ©& oudealesWss

QlluRIeoe LIRYMOERI6DD ?

(ard)

alloyldspass A2 aMIYaOEBE., Qo el
allagoepmu edslsengoe, D @oaveey|
alleonomless edslsenrgo, 100 al.dlgalod
@IOPYSS Qo] afad OBICASUY BB
mldemosmesngs, 100 aLdladlod mierqesoo
@RaldSHeae0cm@a® Gl alrinomia)es
odslsengo low risk alleonosild 9udeajga).
@DBAIBHBHMo HORITVMBMIIQe Gal@m’ TVIW.
MLIGHUOASOBIQ EBSIS MIBEMIEMOPAWD)
M@BHIQYM @ISEMN’ @mamomﬂgg@@omﬁ
(20D BSOS ald@a] @RMENIMW. 3, 4 @R
cmdm’lgmﬁ) edsls mldemosmomImow]
Appendix Al A-©@d @GREaIeu0 adlay; 6aldalg’
adlny’ agyamlal MVadlme @REAIGH TVadaflenemrDo
@REAIGH oJBEIN@IOEMAD HHOEMOMN aldMo 5
dlaimomless]ed @ooulle:0e mudgladleng’
MG SO0 MNTCHEMRDAIEM. @0oUSld:0
qudgladleng aidlaamalges mldanoemamlay’
6a1@alg’ 2IE 5|0 HEMENIHOIYM Do @DSATO

@OBAIBHBHM MIB2NIEMo @Y ©oElED QMM DAI6).

6a1Ralg 0J© M@ GO QI6T @r@@sﬂ@'l%gggo 3
QIBaHo af)M &HOLIVWSAT 5 QAUBHUDILE] &S] @R e d:

6alddgled eoen0iwl 10 aidao

@ &slofigssoaoem.

2019 el co@8 alemio@amy gmlamilajoaigl
edSlsmldanoem algsersleonl onsucwéua I, IT & III-
@3 @REAISUI adlaV, Oaldally’ adlry; eal aDg’
(T}ég’lsrﬁl adlmy agyamlal m%gcﬁnsﬂ_@ﬂ%m“. OO
31/3/2023-ee1 qu.o.(66d) Mo. 85/2023/mauicql
(@B>0@0 al@lay@la] DO EAWIGEE. (20meled

ald@af @oMEMITW. 5 @O cald@migers.)

HIMVHHUM Badlrud

2 of 2



Regn.No. KERBIL/2012/45073
ated 05-09-2012 with RNI

Reg No.KL/TV (N)/634/2021-2023

©
CHOE MBBOHID
Government of Kerala
2023

CHOG NIV

KERALA GAZETTE

@G MVoWImeMo
EXTRAORDINARY

GRWI&I01H20®] (nI1M1R|SOmMO

PUBLISHED BY AUTHORITY

@1 UMD a0, 2023 2m)ue1 19
19th January 2023
QU(o¥o ey e

(:"/DT‘L;I:Z J 1198 A0 5 m“,\’fc? 213
ol Thiruvananthapuram, Sth Makaram 1198
Thursday 1944 6 19Mo 29
29th Pousha 1944
GOVERNMENT OF KERALA
Local Self Government (RD) Department
NOTIFICATION
G.O.(P)No. 9/2023/LSGD. Dated, Thiruvananthapuram, 17" January. 2023.

rd
S. R. O. No. 100/2023 3" Makaram, 1198.

In exercise of the powers conferred under sections 381, 382, 383A, 387, 398 and 406 of the
Kerala Municipality Act, 1994 (Act 20 of 1994) read with section 565 thereof, the Government of
Kerala hereby make the following rules further to amend the Kerala Municipality Building Rules,

Thisisadigitaly signed Gazette.
Authenticity may be verified through https://compose.kerala.gov.in/




2019 issued under notification G.O.(P) No.77/2019/LSGD. dated 2™ November, 2019 and
published as S.R.O. No. 828/2019 in the Kerala Gazette Extraordinary No. 2691 dated 8"

November, 2019 namely:-
RULES

1. Short title and commencement.—(1) These Rules may be called the Kerala Municipality
Building (Amendment) Rules, 2023.
(2) They shall come into force at once.

2. Amendment of the Rules.—In the Kerala Municipality Building Rules, 2019,-

(1) In sub-rule (1), of rule 2,
(a) in the proviso under clause (bf), after the words

“tower structures”, the words “cabin for telecommunication towers or

telecommunication pole structures” shall be inserted;
(b) after clause (bh), the following clause shall be inserted, namely:-

“(bha) ‘In-building solution (IBS) means a telecommunication solution in
buildings which is used to extend and distribute the cellular signals of telecom

operators within a building to provide high quality and seamless connectivity.”
(c) after clause (cha), the following clause shall be inserted, namely:-

“(chb) ‘Pole’ means an installation of a structure below 12m (anything above

12m may be treated as tower).”
(d) after clause (dh) the following clause shall be inserted, namely:-

“(dha) ‘Telecommunication Tower’ means a vertical structure for installation
of antenna(e) that provide radio frequency air interface for telecommunication

services.”

(2) In rule 6,

(a) in sub-rule (6) after clause (v), the following clause shall be inserted, namely:-

Thisisadigitaly signed Gazette.
Authenticity may be verified through https://compose.kerala.gov.in/




“(vi) any in-building service infrastructure to be provided in connection with
Telecommunication/internet, along with required specifications (in consultation
with, and certified by a Credible Telecom Networking hardware-consultant)”

(b) in sub-rule (7), after clause (x), the following clause shall be inserted, namely:-

“(xi) include provisions of in-building solutions, with details of properly
demarcated sections within buildings and on roof tops for housing

broadband/digital connectivity infrastructure/antenna.”

(c) in Table 1, under sub-rule (13) after SI. No. 10, the following Sl. No. shall be

inserted, namely:-

11 Telecom Infrastructure Line Blue

2

(3) In rule 8, after item (xiv), the following item shall be inserted, namely:-

“(xv) Telecommunication tower or telecommunication pole structures or
accessory rooms whereas an intimation shall be submitted to the Secretary as per

Chapter XVIII of these rules.”

(4) in sub-rule (3) of rule 14, the words ‘telecommunication/mobile tower’ shall be

deleted.
(5) After rule 41, the following rule shall be inserted, namely:-

“41A. In-building Solutions.- Necessary provision for in-building solutions
for the small cell deployment including cable ducts and power connections as
stipulated by the Department of Information Technology, Government of Kerala,
from time to time, shall be made mandatory for all buildings other than low risk

buildings.”

(6) For the existing Chapter XVIII the following chapter shall be substituted

Thisisadigitaly signed Gazette.
Authenticity may be verified through https://compose.kerala.gov.in/




83.

“CHAPTER XVIII
TELECOMMUNICATION TOWERS

Essentiality of permit.-No person shall erect or re-erect any non-Governmental

telecommunication tower or telecommunication pole structures or accessory rooms or make

alteration or cause the same to be done without first submitting an intimation in Appendix A5 along

with the required documents and fees to the Secretary for each such tower or telecommunication

pole structures.

84.

Special Provisions.-

(1) Distance from road and boundaries:-

(1) The base of the tower or poles shall have minimum 3 meters distance from the plot

(i)

boundary abutting the road, whether it is proposed on land or over a building, even if the
building is having less than 3 meters distance:

Provided that the distance from road boundary to the accessory rooms such as equipment
rooms, shelters, or generator rooms proposed over a building shall be that of the building.

In addition to the distance specified under sub-rule(1), set back required for road widening
proposed in any Master Plan/Detailed Town Planning Scheme/Interim Development Order
in force under the Kerala Town and Country Planning Act, 2016 (Act 9 of 2016), shall also
be provided.

(iii) Distance from other boundaries of the plot to the base of the telecommunication tower or

Thisisadigitaly signed Gazette.
Authenticity may be verified through https://compose.kerala.gov.in/

pole or structure or accessory rooms shall be minimum 1.20 meters:

Provided that if the telecommunication tower or pole structures or accessory rooms are
proposed over a building, the distance from the boundaries other than that abutting a road,

shall be that of the existing building;

Provided further that if the building abuts any plot boundary and the telecommunication
tower or pole structures or accessory rooms are also proposed to abut that boundary then
consent of the owner of the plot on the abutting side shall be obtained and produced along

with the intimation;

Provided also that no portion of the telecommunication tower, pole structure or accessory

room shall project or over hang into the neighboring plots.




(2) Provisions regarding F.S.I. and height:-
The provisions regarding F.S.I., coverage, height restriction with regard to width of road
and distance from the boundary abutting road and dimension of parts of building shall not
apply to telecommunication towers or pole structures or accessory rooms such as

equipment rooms, cabins, shelters or generator rooms.

Provided that the height of the telecommunication towers or pole structures or accessory
rooms, including the height of the building if they are proposed over a building, shall be
restricted as in sub-rule (2) and (3) of rule 24.

Provided further that additional distance from boundary abutting the road and other
boundaries of the plot proportionate to increase in height of the tower shall not be necessary
for the telecommunication tower or pole structures or accessory rooms or for the building

over which they are proposed.

(3) Accessory rooms: -

(1) In case of accessory rooms such as equipment rooms, cabins or generator rooms
essential for the service that are to be installed along with a telecommunication tower
or telecommunication pole structure or separately, plans/drawings of the rooms shall
be attached either along with the intimation to Secretary or separately.

(i) The accessory room may be made with any material but shall be used only for
housing equipment related to the operation of telecommunication tower or
telecommunication pole structure. The installation of electricity generator is allowed
with insulated sound-proof cabin only.

(iii) Every construction or installation, ancillary or necessary for the telecommunication
system other than telecommunication tower, pole structures, accessory rooms shall
conform to the relevant rules applicable to such construction or installation and
license or permit required under such rules shall also be obtained.

(iv) The telecommunication tower or ancillary structures shall not prevent or block the
access, exit or entry or reduce the width of such access, exit or entry of building or in
no way badly affect the safety measures or amenities provided in the building in
which it is erected.

(4) Electrical line clearance: - Every tower or ancillary construction shall satisfy the minimum

vertical and horizontal clearance from electrical lines as stipulated in the Indian Electricity

Thisisadigitaly signed Gazette.
Authenticity may be verified through https://compose.kerala.gov.in/




Act, 1910 and Indian Electricity Rules, 1956 as amended from time to time and also any
regulation issued by the State Electricity Board.
(5) Protective Wall:-

(1) Every tower erected on the ground and through which electric power is transmitted
or passed shall be provided with protective wall or grill at a distance of minimum
one meter from any point of the base.

(i1)) The wall or grill shall have a minimum of 1.20 meters height and shall be kept
under lock and key, if provided with door.

(6) Protection from lightning:- Every telecommunication tower shall be provided with
sufficient protection against lightning, conforming to I.S. 2303-1969-Code of Practice, as
amended from time to time.

(7) Warning lights and colour specifications:- Every telecommunication tower, above 40
meter height, shall be provided with Warning Lights (ANL) and colour specifications as

stipulated by the Telecommunication Department or any other applicable statutes.

85. Damage and liability.-(1) The applicant/owner/Telecom service provider shall be
responsible for the structural stability of the telecommunication tower and the building in

which it is erected and for any damage caused due to inadequate safety measures.

(2) Erection of any telecommunication tower or pole structures or accessory rooms shall be

done only over authorised buildings which are structurally safe.

86. Town Planning Scheme provisions.-Telecommunication towers or pole structures or
accessory rooms can be erected in any zone of Master Plan/ Detailed Town Planning
Scheme/Interim Development Order in force under the Kerala Town and Country Planning

Act, 2016 (Act 9 0of 2016) if any, or over any building irrespective of its occupancy.

87.  Submission of intimation.-(1) Intimation for erection or re-erection or alteration of any
non-Governmental telecommunication tower or telecommunication pole structures or
accessory rooms shall be submitted to the Secretary in the form in Appendix A5 along with

the following documents:

(i) Two copies of site plan, location, elevation, sectional elevation for

Thisisadigitaly signed Gazette.
Authenticity may be verified through https://compose.kerala.gov.in/




(i)

(iii)

(iv)

(V)

(vi)

Telecommunication towers and two copies of site plan and location plan in the case

of telecommunication pole structures

structural stability certificate if required as per these rules

copy of agreement executed with department of Telecommunications or license or

permit issued by an authority approved by Government of India from time to time

document to prove ownership

receipt of payment of fee for erection of Telecommunication towers or pole

structures or accessory rooms

required NOC as per rule 5(4) of these rules and other applicable statutes

The submission of intimation gives the right for the applicant to proceed with commencement of

work.

Note:-(1) Ownership document may be a property tax receipt or land tax receipt or

mortgage deed or deed of agreement or license or consent document.

(2) No structural stability certificate shall be necessary in the case of telecommunication

pole structures and accessory rooms.

(3) In case the telecommunication tower is proposed above any building, structural

4)

()

Thisisadigitaly signed Gazette.
Authenticity may be verified through https://compose.kerala.gov.in/

stability certificate shall be submitted in respect of that building also.

The site plan shall show plot dimensions, access street width, details of existing
structures within the plot with their uses, height, number of floors, set back from the
plot boundaries and between them; proposed tower and ancillary structures for
telecommunication towers. In the case of telecommunication pole structures, the site
plan shall show plot dimensions, details of the existing structure and proposed
location of the pole structure in the existing site.

The structural stability certificate shall be prepared and issued by a Structural
Engineer registered as per these rules. In the case of towers erected by Central or
State Government or Quasi-Government Organisation, the structural stability

certificate may be prepared and issued by a competent engineer employed in such




firms. The drawings submitted shall also be duly certified for the structural stability.
In the case of telecommunication pole structures, structural stability certificate is not
necessary.

(6) Fee for erection or re-erection or alteration of any non-Governmental
telecommunication tower or telecommunication pole structures or accessory rooms
shall be:-

(a) For towers of any height, rupees ten thousand;

(b) For pole structures rupees two thousand and five hundred; and

(c) For the accessory rooms essential for the use of telecommunication tower or
pole structures, fee at the rate of Rs.15 per sq. m. of built-up area shall be

remitted.

88.  Completion Report.-(1)  After completion of the work of the telecommunication tower
or pole structures and accessory rooms the applicant and/or the service provider and the
engineer shall submit a completion report in writing to the Secretary along with a copy of
the intimation submitted to the Secretary prior to the construction of the telecommunication

tower or pole structures and accessory rooms as the case may be.

(2) The Secretary can carry out inspection to check whether the telecommunication tower or
pole structures and accessory rooms are erected as per the provisions in these rules at any

time.”

(7) After Appendix A4, the following Appendix shall be inserted namely:-

Thisisadigitaly signed Gazette.
Authenticity may be verified through https://compose.kerala.gov.in/




“APPENDIX- AS
(See rules 83, 87)

APPLICATION FOR INTIMATION FOR THE ERECTION/RE-ERECTION/
ALTERATION OF TELECOMMUNICATION TOWERS/TELECOMMUNICATION POLE
STRUCTURES/ACCESSORY ROOMS
................................................................... Municipal ~ Corporation/  Municipal

Council/Town Panchayat

1. Name and address of Applicant(s)/Owner(s)

2. Name and address of the Infrastructure service
provider /Telecom service provider

3. Nature of development:

(1) Erection of Telecommunication towers/
pole structures/accessory rooms

(i)  Re-erection of Telecommunication towers/
pole structures/accessory rooms

(1)  Alteration of Telecommunication towers/
pole structures/accessory rooms

4. Details of plot:
(1) Revenue Village
(i1) (a) Survey No
(b) Resurvey No

(ii1) Sub Division

(iv) Taluk

(v) District

(vi) Extent in Sq.m

(vii)Ward No.

(viii) Authorised number of the building over

which the telecommunication structure is

Thisisadigitaly signed Gazette.
Authenticity may be verified through https://compose.kerala.gov.in/




proposed (if applicable)

10

(ix) Authorised number of the nearest building

(x) Nearest Electric Post/Telecom Post number

5. Whether the land, if any, contiguous to this plot

of the owner shown in the site plan (Rule 6(4)(a)(1)) : Yes /No
6. Whether Government or Quasi-Government
7. Details of the Telecommunication structure
a. Height of the structure
8. Provisions of Schemes, if any, applicable to the construction
Road Widening
Set Back
. Required
Name Existing | Propose o
SL | ofthe | 0% | Widthof | d Width | suilding | from - Set back
(Sanctioned Line (in Existing provided
No. TP . road of road .
/ Published) . . m) road (in m)
Scheme (in m) (in m)
boundary
(in m)

9.  Details of fee paid:

(i) Amount

(i1) No. and date of receipt

10.

11. Details of NOC obtained.

Details of documents, plans, certificate, etc. enclosed.

SL.
No

Required

Whether enclosed or not

Details of the NOC /
Clearances

Thisisadigitaly signed Gazette.
Authenticity may be verified through https://compose.kerala.gov.in/




11

12. DECLARATION

........................................................................................ hereby declare that the
measurements, specifications and other details mentioned above are correct, complete and true to
the best of my knowledge and belief and that I shall abide by the approved plan and the provisions

in the Act and Rules in undertaking the construction.

Signature of the Applicant(s)/Owner(s) with name

Signature of the Infrastructure service provider/

Telecom service provider

Place:

Date:

13. CERTIFICATE
Certified that the site plan is prepared after verification of ownership document and site and the

measurements shown are found to be correct.

Signature:

Name:
Place: Reg.No.:
Date: Address:

(Registered Institution/ Architect/Engineer/ Town

Planner/Supervisor)

Thisisadigitaly signed Gazette.
Authenticity may be verified through https://compose.kerala.gov.in/




12

14. UNDERTAKING
P hereby undertake that the erection of  the
telecommunication tower/telecommunication pole structure/accessory rooms and/or land

development will be carried on/being carried on/was carried on in accordance with the rules in

force.

Place: Signature:

Date: Name:
Reg.No.:
Address:

(Registered Institution/ Architect/Engineer/

Town Planner/ Supervisor)”

By order of the Governor,

DR SHARMILA MARY JOSEPH,

Principal Secretary to Government.

Explanatory Note

(This does not form part of the notification, but is intended to indicate its general purport.)

As part of the Government's strategy to promote usage of 5G network, erection of
Telecommunication towers, telecommunication pole structures, accessory rooms are essential. It is
essential to provide necessary provisions to intimate the erection of Telecommunication towers,
telecommunication pole structures, accessory rooms to the Secretary. In accordance with the
provisions of the Kerala Municipality Act, 1994 (Act 20 of 1994), Government has decided to
amend further the Kerala Municipality Building Rules, 2019 suitably.

The notification is intended to achieve the above object.

PUBLISHED BY THE SUPERINTENDENT OF GOVERNMENT PRESSES
AT THE GOVERNMENT CENTRAL PRESS, THIRUVANANTHAPURAM, 2021«

Thisisadigitaly signed Gazette.
Authenticity may be verified through https://compose.kerala.gov.in/




Regn.No. KERBIL/2012/45073
ated 05-09-2012 with RNI

Reg No.KL/TV (N)/634/2021-2023

©
CHOE MBBOHID
Government of Kerala
2023

CHOG NIV

KERALA GAZETTE

@G MVoWImeMo
EXTRAORDINARY

GRWI&I01H20®] (nI1M1R|SOmMO

PUBLISHED BY AUTHORITY

@1 UMD a0, 2023 2m)ue1 19
19th January 2023
Qoo oy a

(:"/DT‘L;I:Z J 1198 A0 5 m“,\’fc? 214
ol Thiruvananthapuram, Sth Makaram 1198
Thursday 1944 0a1DMo 29
29th Pousha 1944
GOVERNMENT OF KERALA
Local Self Government (RD) Department
NOTIFICATION
G.O.(P)No. 10/2023/LSGD. Dated, Thiruvananthapuram, 17" January. 2023.

rd
S.R. O. No. 101/2023 3" Makaram, 1198.

In exercise of the powers conferred by sections 235A, 235B, 235F, 235P, 235W read with
section 254 of the Kerala Panchayat Raj Act, 1994 (Act 13 of 1994), the Government of Kerala
hereby make the following Rules further to amend the Kerala Panchayat Building Rules, 2019

Thisisadigitaly signed Gazette.
Authenticity may be verified through https://compose.kerala.gov.in/




issued under notification G.O.(P.) No. 78/2019/LSGD. dated 2™ November, 2019 and published as
S.R.O. No. 829/2019 in the Kerala Gazette Extraordinary No. 2692 dated 8™ November, 2019

namely:-

RULES

1. Short title and commencement.—(1) These Rules may be called the Kerala Panchayat

Building (Amendment) Rules, 2023.
(2) They shall come into force at once.

2. Amendment of the Rules.—In the Kerala Panchayat Building Rules, 2019,-
(1) In sub-rule (1), of rule 2,
(a) in the proviso under clause (bf), after the words

“tower structures”, the words “cabin for telecommunication towers or

telecommunication pole structures” shall be inserted;
(b) after clause (bh), the following clause shall be inserted, namely:-

“(bha) ‘In-building solution’ (IBS) means a telecommunication solution in
buildings which is used to extend and distribute the cellular signals of telecom

operators within a building to provide high quality and seamless connectivity.”
(c) after clause (cha), the following clause shall be inserted, namely:-

“(chb) ‘Pole’ means an installation of a structure below 12m (anything above

12m may be treated as tower).”
(d) after clause (dh) the following clause shall be inserted, namely:-

“(dha) ‘Telecommunication Tower’ means a vertical structure for installation
of antenna(e) that provide radio frequency air interface for telecommunication

services.”
(2) In rule (6),

(a) in sub-rule (6) after clause (v), the following clause shall be inserted, namely:-

Thisisadigitaly signed Gazette.
Authenticity may be verified through https://compose.kerala.gov.in/




“(vi) any in-building service infrastructure to be provided in connection with
Telecommunication/internet, along with required specifications (in consultation

with, and certified by a Credible Telecom Networking hardware-consultant).”
(b) in sub-rule (7), after clause (x), the following clause shall be inserted, namely:-

“(x1) include provisions of in-building solutions, with details of properly
demarcated sections within buildings and on roof tops for housing

broadband/digital connectivity infrastructure/antenna.”

(c) in Table 1, under sub-rule (13), after Sl. No. 10, the following SI. No. shall be

inserted, namely:-

(13

11 Telecom Infrastructure Line Blue

(3) In rule 8, after item (xvi), the following item shall be inserted, namely:—

“(xvii) Telecommunication tower or telecommunication pole structures or
accessory rooms whereas an intimation shall be submitted to the Secretary as

per Chapter XVIII of these rules.”

(4) in sub-rule (3) of rule 14, the words ‘telecommunication/mobile tower’ shall be

deleted.
(5) After rule 41, the following rule shall be inserted,

“41A. In-building Solutions.-Necessary provision for in-building solutions
for the small cell deployment including cable ducts and power connections as
stipulated by the Department of Information Technology, Government of Kerala,
from time to time, shall be made mandatory for all buildings other than low risk

buildings.”

(6) For the existing Chapter XVIII the following Chapter, shall be substituted namely:-

Thisisadigitaly signed Gazette.
Authenticity may be verified through https://compose.kerala.gov.in/




“CHAPTER XVIII
TELECOMMUNICATION TOWERS

83. Essentiality of permit.-No person shall erect or re-erect any non-Governmental

telecommunication tower or telecommunication pole structures or accessory rooms or make

alteration or cause the same to be done without first submitting an intimation in Appendix A5 along

with the required documents and fees to the Secretary for each such tower or telecommunication

pole structures.

84. Special Provisions.-

1)
(1)

(i)

(iii)

Thisisadigitaly signed Gazette.
Authenticity may be verified through https://compose.kerala.gov.in/

Distance from road and boundaries:-

The base of the tower or poles shall have minimum 3 meters distance from the plot
boundary abutting the road, whether it is proposed on land or over a building, even if the
building is having less than 3 meters distance:

Provided that the distance from road boundary to the accessory rooms such as equipment
rooms, shelters, or generator rooms proposed over a building shall be that of the building.
In addition to the distance specified under sub-rule(1), set back required for road
widening proposed in any Master Plan/Detailed Town Planning Scheme/Interim
Development Order in force under the Kerala Town and Country Planning Act, 2016 (Act
9 0of 2016), shall also be provided.

Distance from other boundaries of the plot to the base of the telecommunication tower or

pole or structure or accessory rooms shall be minimum 1.20 meters:

Provided that if the telecommunication tower or pole structures or accessory rooms are
proposed over a building, the distance from the boundaries other than that abutting a road,

shall be that of the existing building;

Provided further that if the building abuts any plot boundary and the telecommunication
tower or pole structures or accessory rooms are also proposed to abut that boundary then
consent of the owner of the plot on the abutting side shall be obtained and produced along

with the intimation;

Provided also that no portion of the telecommunication tower, pole structure or accessory

room shall project or over hang into the neighboring plots.




(2) Provisions regarding F.S.1. and height:-
The provisions regarding F.S.I., coverage, height restriction with regard to width of road
and distance from the boundary abutting road and dimension of parts of building shall not
apply to telecommunication towers or pole structures or accessory rooms such as

equipment rooms, cabins, shelters or generator rooms.

Provided that the height of the telecommunication towers or pole structures or accessory
rooms, including the height of the building if they are proposed over a building, shall be
restricted as in sub-rule(2) and (3) of rule 24.

Provided further that additional distance from boundary abutting the road and other
boundaries of the plot proportionate to increase in height of the tower shall not be
necessary for the telecommunication tower or pole structures or accessory rooms or for

the building over which they are proposed.

(3) Accessory rooms: -

(1) In case of accessory rooms such as equipment rooms, cabins or generator rooms
essential for the service that are to be installed along with a telecommunication tower
or telecommunication pole structure or separately, plans/drawings of the rooms shall
be attached either along with the intimation to Secretary or separately.

(i) The accessory room may be made with any material but shall be used only for
housing equipment related to the operation of telecommunication tower or
telecommunication pole structure. The installation of electricity generator is allowed
with insulated sound-proof cabin only.

(ii1) Every construction or installation, ancillary or necessary for the telecommunication
system other than telecommunication tower, pole structures, and accessory rooms
shall conform to the relevant rules applicable to such construction or installation and
license or permit required under such rules shall also be obtained.

(iv) The telecommunication tower or ancillary structures shall not prevent or block the
access, exit or entry or reduce the width of such access, exit or entry of building or in
no way badly affect the safety measures or amenities provided in the building in
which it is erected.

(4) Electrical line clearance:- Every tower or ancillary construction shall satisfy the

minimum vertical and horizontal clearance from electrical lines as stipulated in the Indian

Thisisadigitaly signed Gazette.
Authenticity may be verified through https://compose.kerala.gov.in/




Electricity Act, 1910 and Indian Electricity Rules, 1956 as amended from time to time
and also any regulation issued by the State Electricity Board.
(5) Protective Wall:-

(1) Every tower erected on the ground and through which electric power is transmitted
or passed shall be provided with protective wall or grill at a distance of minimum one
meter from any point of the base.

(i1) The wall or grill shall have a minimum of 1.20 meters height and shall be kept under
lock and key, if provided with door.

(6) Protection from lightning:- Every telecommunication tower shall be provided with
sufficient protection against lightning, conforming to I.S. 2303-1969-Code of Practice, as
amended from time to time.

(7) Warning lights and colour specifications:- Every telecommunication tower, above 40
meters height, shall be provided with Warning Lights (ANL) and colour specifications as
stipulated by the Telecommunication Department or any other applicable statutes.

85. Damage and liability.-(1) The applicant/owner/Telecom service provider shall be
responsible for the structural stability of the telecommunication tower and the building in
which it is erected and for any damage caused due to inadequate safety measures.

(2) Erection of any telecommunication tower or pole structures or accessory rooms shall

be done only over authorised buildings which are structurally safe.

86. Town Planning Scheme provisions.- Telecommunication towers or pole structures or
accessory rooms can be erected in any zone of Master Plan/Detailed Town Planning
Scheme/Interim Development Order in force under the Kerala Town and Country Planning

Act, 2016 (Act 9 of 2016) if any, or over any building irrespective of its occupancy.

87. Submission of intimation.-(1)Intimation for erection or re-erection or alteration of any
non-Governmental telecommunication tower or telecommunication pole structures or
accessory rooms shall be submitted to the Secretary in the form in Appendix A5 along

with the following documents:-

(i) Two copies of site plan, location, elevation, sectional elevation for
Telecommunication towers and two copies of site plan and location plan in the case

of telecommunication pole structures

Thisisadigitaly signed Gazette.
Authenticity may be verified through https://compose.kerala.gov.in/




(i)

(iii)

(iv)

(vi)

structural stability certificate if required as per these rules

copy of agreement executed with department of Telecommunications or license or

permit issued by an authority approved by Government of India from time to time

document to prove ownership

receipt of payment of fee for erection Telecommunication towers or pole structures

Or acCcessory rooms

required NOC as per rule 5(4) of these rules and other applicable statutes

The submission of intimation gives the right for the applicant to proceed with commencement of

work.

Note:- (1) Ownership document may be property tax receipt or land tax receipt or

mortgage deed or deed of agreement or license or consent document.

(2) No structural stability certificate shall be necessary in the case of telecommunication

pole structures and accessory rooms.

(3) In case the telecommunication tower is proposed above any building, structural

4)

()

Thisisadigitaly signed Gazette.
Authenticity may be verified through https://compose.kerala.gov.in/

stability certificate shall be submitted in respect of that building also.

The site plan shall show plot dimensions, access street width, details of existing
structures within the plot with their uses, height, number of floors, set back from the
plot boundaries and between them; proposed tower and ancillary structures for
telecommunication towers. In the case of telecommunication pole structures, the site
plan shall show plot dimensions, details of the existing structure and proposed
location of the pole structure in the existing site.

The structural stability certificate shall be prepared and issued by a Structural
Engineer registered as per these rules. In the case of towers erected by Central or
State Government or Quasi-Government Organisation, the structural stability
certificate may be prepared and issued by a competent engineer employed in such
firms. The drawings submitted shall also be duly certified for the structural stability.

In the case of telecommunication pole structures, structural stability certificate is not




88.

Thisisadigitaly signed Gazette.
Authenticity may be verified through https://compose.kerala.gov.in/

necessary.

(6) Fee for erection or re-erection or alteration of any non-Governmental
telecommunication tower or telecommunication pole structures or accessory rooms
shall be:-

(a) For towers of any height, rupees ten thousand,
(b) For pole structures rupees two thousand and five hundred; and
(c) For the accessory rooms essential for the use of telecommunication tower or
pole structures, fee, at the rate of Rs.15 per sq. m. of built-up area shall be
remitted.
Completion Report.-(1) After completion of the work of the telecommunication tower
or pole structures and accessory rooms the applicant and /or the service provider and the
engineer shall submit a completion report in writing to the Secretary along with a copy of
the intimation submitted to the Secretary prior to the construction of the
telecommunication tower or pole structures and accessory rooms as the case may be.
(2) The Secretary can carry out inspection to check whether the telecommunication
tower or pole structures and accessory rooms are erected as per the provisions in these

rules at any time.”

(7) After Appendix A4, the following Appendix shall be inserted namely:-




“APPENDIX- A5
(See rules 83, 87)

APPLICATION FOR INTIMATION FOR THE ERECTION/RE-ERECTION/
ALTERATION OF TELECOMMUNICATION TOWERS/TELECOMMUNICATION POLE
STRUCTURES/ACCESSORY ROOMS
................................................................... Panchayat

1. Name and address of Applicant(s)/Owner(s)

2. Name and address of the Infrastructure service

provider /Telecom service provider

3. Nature of development:
(1) Erection of Telecommunication towers/
pole structures/accessory rooms
(i) Re-erection of Telecommunication towers/
pole structures/accessory rooms
(iii) Alteration of Telecommunication towers/
pole structures/accessory rooms
4. Details of plot:
(1) Revenue Village
(i1) (a) Survey No
(b) Re-survey No
(iii) Sub Division
(iv) Taluk
(v) District
(vi) Extent in Sq.m
(vii)Ward No.

(viii) Authorised number of the building over which the
telecommunication structure is proposed (if applicable):

(ix) Authorised number of the nearest building

Thisisadigitaly signed Gazette.
Authenticity may be verified through https://compose.kerala.gov.in/




10

(x) Nearest Electric Post/Telecom Post number

5. Whether the land, if any, contiguous to this plot

of the owner shown in the site plan (Rule 6(4)(a)(1)) : Yes /No
6 . Whether Government or Quasi-Government
7. Details of the Telecommunication structure
a. Height of the structure
8. Provisions of Schemes, if any, applicable to the construction
Road Widening
Set Back
Required
Name Existing | Proposed o
Stage Building from Set back
SI1. of the ‘ Width | Width of . o .
(Sanctioned Line Existing | provided
No. TP . ofroad |road (in . .
/Published) ' (in m) road (in m)
Scheme (in m) m)
boundary
(in m)
9.  Details of fee paid:
(i) Amount
(i) No. and date of receipt
10. Details of documents, plans, certificate, etc. enclosed.
11. Details of NOC obtained.
SL . | Required Whether enclosed or not Details of the NOC /
No

Clearances

Thisisadigitaly signed Gazette.
Authenticity may be verified through https://compose.kerala.gov.in/




11
12. DECLARATION

........................................................................................ hereby declare that the
measurements, specifications and other details mentioned above are correct, complete and true to
the best of my knowledge and belief and that I shall abide by the approved plan and the provisions

in the Act and Rules in undertaking the construction.

Signature of the Applicant(s)/Owner(s) with name

Signature of the Infrastructure service provider

/Telecom service provider

Place:

Date:

13. CERTIFICATE
Certified that the site plan is prepared after verification of ownership document and site and the

measurements shown are found to be correct.

Signature:

Name:
Place: Reg.No.:
Date: Address:

(Registered Institution/ Architect/Engineer/

Town Planner/ Supervisor)

Thisisadigitaly signed Gazette.
Authenticity may be verified through https://compose.kerala.gov.in/




12

14. UNDERTAKING

hereby undertake that the erection of  the
telecommunication tower/telecommunication pole structure/accessory rooms and/or land

development will be carried on/being carried on/was carried on in accordance with the rules in

force.

Place: Signature:

Date: Name:
Reg.No.:
Address:

(Registered Institution/Architect/Engineer/

Town Planner/ Supervisor)”

By order of the Governor,

DR SHARMILA MARY JOSEPH,

Principal Secretary to Government.
Explanatory Note
(This does not form part of the notification, but is intended to indicate its general purport.)

As part of the Government's strategy to promote usage of 5G network, erection of
Telecommunication towers, telecommunication pole structures, accessory rooms are essential. It is
essential to provide necessary provisions to intimate the erection of Telecommunication towers,
telecommunication pole structures, accessory rooms to the Secretary. In accordance with the
provisions of the Kerala Panchayat Raj Act, 1994 (Act 13 of 1994), Government has decided to
amend further the Kerala Panchayat Building Rules, 2019 suitably.

The notification is intended to achieve the above object.

PUBLISHED BY THE SUPERINTENDENT OF GOVERNMENT PRESSES
AT THE GOVERNMENT CENTRAL PRESS, THIRUVANANTHAPURAM, 2023,

Thisisadigitaly signed Gazette.
Authenticity may be verified through https://compose.kerala.gov.in/



©
CHOE MBBOHID
Government of Kerala
2021

Regn.No. KERBIL/2012/45073
ated 05-09-2012 with RNI

Reg No.KL/TV (N)/634/2021-2023

CHOG NIV
KERALA GAZETTE

G VoWImeMo
EXTRAORDINARY

GRW®IQ1H2IW] (aIM]EDOA SO0

PUBLISHED BY AUTHORITY

® 1) UMD L) o, 2021 )6 29
29th June 2021
Qudelfo 10 821502} —
VoIJ;( 1196 2illnyMo 15 m“,\’f? 1898
. Thiruvananthapuram, 15th Mithunam 1196
Tuesday 1943 @R HUIWo 8
8th Ashadha 1943

GOVERNMENT OF KERALA
Local Self Government (RD) Department

NOTIFICATION

G.0.(Ms.) No.121/2021/LSGD. Dated, Thiruvananthapuram, 28th June, 2021
14th Mithunam, 1196.

S. R. O. No. 483/2021
In exercise of the powers conferred under sections 381, 382, 387,392 A, 398 and 406 of

the Kerala Municipality Act, 1994 (20 of 1994) read with section 565 thereof, the Government of
Kerala hereby make the following rules further to amend the Kerala Municipality Building Rules,
2019 issued under notification G.O.(P)No.77/2019/LSGD. dated 2nd November, 2019 and
published as S.R.O. No. 828/2019 in the Kerala Gazette Extraordinary No. 2691 dated 8th

November, 2019, namely:—

Thisisadigitaly signed Gazette.
Authenticity may be verified through https://compose.kerala.gov.in/




RULES

1. Short title and commencement.—(1) These Rules may be called the Kerala Municipality
Building (Amendment) Rules, 2021.

(2) They shall come into force at once.

2. Amendment of the Rules.— In the Kerala Municipality Building Rules, 2019,
(1) In rule 2, in sub-rule (1),

(a) In clause (i), the following sentence shall be added after the words “duly
approved by the Secretary” namely:—

“It also includes self certified building permit along with the acknowledgment by
the Secretary”

(b) the following clause shall be inserted after clause (bn) namely:—

“(bna) 'low risk buildings' include residential buildings under Group A1 occupancy,
with built up area of less than three hundred square meters and height less than seven
meters and limited to two storeys, hostel, orphanage, dormetry, old age home, seminary
under Group A2 occupancy having built up area less than two hundred square meters,
educational buildings under Group B occupancy having built up area less than two
hundred square meters, Group D occupancy buildings where persons congregate for
religious and patriotic purposes having built up area less than two hundred square
meters, Group F occupancy buildings having built up area less than one hundred square
meters, Group G1 occupancy buildings without any nuisance and not dangerous and
having built up area less than one hundred square meters”

(c) the following clause shall be inserted after clause (ce) namely:—

“(cea) ‘Plinth level inspection’ is defined as the inspection at site as prescribed
when the construction reaches at the plinth level. In the case of pile foundation this
inspection is done at the stage where pile cap is completed. Plinth level inspection shall
be carried out for low risk buildings.”;

(d) the following clause shall be inserted after clause (cs) namely:-

“(csa) 'Self Certification' means self certification issued jointly by the owner of the
building and the empanelled licensee to the effect that, the building plan and site plan for

the construction or reconstruction of the low risk buildings, are in accordance with the

Thisisadigitaly signed Gazette.
Authenticity may be verified through https://compose.kerala.gov.in/




provisions of the Act and rules, for the time being in force, and any lawful direction
issued, any stipulation as to the standard of specifications laws, rules and directions.”;
(2) In rule 3, in clause (e) of sub-rule (4) for the words “District Town Planning
Scheme”, the words, “Detailed Town Planning Scheme” shall be substituted

(3) Inrule 4, for sub-rule (2) the following sub-rule shall be substituted, namely:-

“(2) No person shall construct or reconstruct or make addition or extension or
alteration to any building or cause the same to be done without first obtaining a building
permit from the Secretary and in the case of low risk building without obtaining an
Acknowledgment Receipt which shall be deemed to be a permit from the Secretary;”

(4) Inrule 5,
(1) insub-rule (1), after clause (b) the following shall be inserted, namely:-

“(c) to construct or reconstruct a building or make alteration or addition or
extension or change in occupancy may file an application to the Secretary for approval of
building site and for permission to execute the work with self certification in Form in
Appendix A1A along with documents as specified in rule 19A:”

(i1) In the Table under sub-rule (4), against S1.No.5 in column (1), in column

(3) under the heading Officer/authority, for the words “District Collector”, the word
“Municipality” shall be substituted.

(5) In rule 10, in sub-rule (5), after the words “issue of permit”, the words “or self

certified building permit” shall be inserted;

(6) In Rule 12, for the words “thirty days”, the words “fifteen days” shall be
substituted.

(7) In Rule 13, for the words “thirty days”, the words “fifteen days” shall be
substituted.

(8) In Rule 14,-

(@) in sub-rule (1) for the words “thirty days”, the words “fifteen days” shall be
substituted.

Thisisadigitaly signed Gazette.
Authenticity may be verified through https://compose.kerala.gov.in/




(b) in sub-rule (3) for the words “sixty days”, the words “forty five days” shall be
substituted,;

(9) Inrule 15,-

(@ insub-rule (1), after the words “building permit” the words “acknowledgment
receipt which shall be deemed to be permit” shall be inserted,

(b) in sub-rule (2), after the words “five years”, the following sentence shall be

added, namely:-

“In the case of acknowledgment certificate which shall be deemed to be a
permit for another five years is to be intimated by a letter signed by the owner and

empanelled licensee to the Secretary.”;

(c) in sub-rule (4), after the words “ten years”, the following sentence shall be

added namely:-

“In the case of acknowledgment certificate which shall be deemed to be
permit the intention to renew the same for another five years is to be intimated by

a letter signed by the owner and empanelled licensee to the Secretary.”;
(10) After the rule 19, the following rules shall be inserted namely

“19A Procedure for grant of acknowledgment certificate.—(1)In the case of low

risk buildings application shall be submitted to the Secretary with the application fee and
permit fee, along with Self certification in Appendix A1A, self certified building permit in
Appendix O along with the documents specified in sub-rule (1) of rule 5 of these rules.

(2) On receipt of the application in Appendix A1A under sub-rule (1) complete in
all respects the Secretary shall within five working days issue an Acknowledgment
Certificate in Appendix A1B.

(3) The applicant may commence construction from the date of commencement of
construction mentioned in the self certified building permit in Appendix O. All plans

submitted shall be certified by the empanelled licensee as given in Appendix J1.

Thisisadigitaly signed Gazette.
Authenticity may be verified through https://compose.kerala.gov.in/




(4) Clearances and NOCs from any authorities concerned required under these rules
or any other relevant Act or Rules and their amendments shall be submitted along with the

application.

(5) Constructions which involve excavations to a depth of more than 1.5 metres are

not eligible for acknowledgment receipt.

“19B. Other conditions pertaining to self certification.

(1) At any stage of construction of low risk buildings, if the empanelled licensee
who issued self certified building permit, notices that such building is being constructed
in violation of such building plan, empanelled licensee as intimate to the authority of
such violations and stop further supervision. The empanelled licensee shall submit
complete details along with photographs of the building being constructed to the

concerned authority;

(2) The Secretary shall immediately issue a notice to the owner on the basis of the
intimation received from the empanelled licensee to suspend further work and rectify
violations. In such cases the owner shall not make further additions in violation of the
conditions. The owner may, after removal of violations, engage an emapanelled licensee
for preparing the revised drawings for obtaining revised self certified building permit. In
such cases occupancy certificate shall be given only after scrutiny of revised self certified

building permit and inspection of site;

(3) After submission of application or during the construction of building if there
is change in the owner or the empanelled licensee, the person concerned shall intimate
the Secretary in writing or through online building plan approval system that he is no
longer responsible for the construction project from the date of receipt of the intimation.
The information must be sent within seven days of occurrence of the change to the
Secretary by the respective owner/ empanelled licensee. The construction work shall have
to be suspended until the new owner / empanelled licensee, as the case may be, undertake
the full responsibility of the project by submitting in writing to the Secretary intimating

the same.

Thisisadigitaly signed Gazette.
Authenticity may be verified through https://compose.kerala.gov.in/




(4) Secretary or any other person authorized reserves the right to check the
building plans and construction at any stage and violations, if found shall have to be
rectified by the owner. In case the owner fail to rectify violations, the Secretary shall take
necessary steps to rectify the violations.

19C. Issue of occupancy certificate.—After the completion of the construction of the

building as per the self certified building permit, the occupancy certificate be issued in form
Appendix F2A.

19D. Procedure for plinth level inspection for low risk buildings.— In the case of Low

risk buildings the empanelled licensee shall conduct plinth level inspection and shall submit
the Inspection Report, in Appendix P to the Secretary. The Secretary or the officer authorized
by him may offer remarks on Appendix P submitted by the empanelled licensee and inform the
same along with the observed deviation or objection, if any, to the owner within five days from
the date of receipt of such intimation. The following documents shall be submitted along with
Appendix P:

(1) Building plans indicating the plinth constructed at site in relation to the plot
dimensions, area and setbacks, duly signed by the owner and empanelled

licensee.

(i) Signed photograph(s) with date showing construction up to plinth level at
site.

19E. Procedure for plinth level inspection for all other buildings.—(1) In case of all

other buildings, on completion of work up to plinth level, the owner, through his registered
Architect/ Institution/ Building Designer/ Town Planner/ Engineer/ Supervisor, shall
submit an intimation of such completion in Appendix P to the Secretary to enable the
Secretary or the person authorized by him to verify that the work conforms to the approved
plans and building bye-laws and relevant Acts and Rules. After plinth level inspection the
Secretary or the person authorized by him shall offer remarks on Appendix P submitted by
the registered Architect/ Institution/ Building Designer/ Town Planner/ Engineer/

Supervisor and inform the same along with the observed deviation or objection, if any, to

Thisisadigitaly signed Gazette.
Authenticity may be verified through https://compose.kerala.gov.in/




the owner within 5 days from the receipt of such intimation. The following documents shall

be submitted along with the intimation, namely:—

1) Building plans indicating the plinth constructed at site in relation to the plot
dimensions, area and setbacks, duly signed by the owner and registered Architect/

Institution/ Building Designer/ Town Planner/ Engineer/ Supervisor.

i) Signed photograph(s) with date showing construction up to plinth level at site.

(2) No further construction shall be continued without the submission of plinth level
inspection report.

19F. Deemed completion of plinth level inspection.—In case the owner who

submitted the intimation on plinth level inspection receives no communication from the
Secretary within 7 days of such intimation, plinth level inspection shall be deemed to have
been completed without any deviation having been noticed. It shall be the responsibility of
the owner / Empanelled licensee / registered Architect/ Institution/ Building Designer/
Town Planner/ Engineer/ Supervisor to ensure that the building is constructed in

accordance with the approved plan.
(12) Inrule 25, in sub-rule 2,

in clause (1), for the words “Fire and Rescue Department”, the words “Department of Fire
and Rescue Services” shall be substituted;

(12) In rule 28, in sub-rule (1),—

(1) In the twelfth proviso and thirteenth proviso, for the words “total built up area”

the words “total floor area” shall be substituted;

(2) In sub-rule (2) and sub-rule (3), for the words “total built up area” the words

“total floor area” shall be substituted;

(3) after the fourteenth proviso, the following proviso shall be inserted, namely:—

Thisisadigitaly signed Gazette.
Authenticity may be verified through https://compose.kerala.gov.in/




“Provided also that in the case of buildings intended for the storage of LPG
cylinders designated as white category as per the norms of the Pollution Control

Board, the access width shall not be less than 6 metres.”;
(23) In rule 43, after sub-rule (2) the following sub-rules shall be inserted, namely:—

“(3) Provision for LPG piped gas system/ LPG articulate system shall be provided in all

apartments with adequate safety measures.

“(4) In the case of existing apartments, provision for LPG piped gas system/ LPG articulate
system shall be provided within 3 years of the date of commencement of the Kerala Municipality
Building (Amendment) Rules, 2021.”;

(14) In rule 52, for the words “Social Welfare Department”, the words “Social Justice

Department” shall be substituted;

(15) In rule 99, the following sub-rule shall be inserted, namely:—

“(7) For providing self certified building permit, a registered Architect/ Institution/
Building Designer/ Town Planner/ Engineer/ Supervisor shall empanel with the registering
authority and shall submit an application in Appendix Q for empanelment. All empanelled

licensees shall undergo training as prescribed by Government from time to time.

The fee for empanelment shall be the rates shown below:

Acrchitect : Rs 12000
Building Designer A : Rs 12000
Building Designer B : Rs 10000
Engineer A : Rs 12000
Engineer B : Rs 10000
Town Planner A : Rs 12000
Town Planner B : Rs 10000
Supervisor Senior : Rs 8000

Supervisor A : Rs 6000

Supervisor B : Rs 4000~

Thisisadigitaly signed Gazette.
Authenticity may be verified through https://compose.kerala.gov.in/




(16) Amendment of Appendix A,-In Appendix Al, in the table under SI. No. 10, the
following item shall be added as SI. No. 13 namely:-
“connected load in KW for buildings coming under rule 2.1 and 2.2 of Kerala State

Energy Conservation Building Code Rules 2017”

Thisisadigitaly signed Gazette.
Authenticity may be verified through https://compose.kerala.gov.in/




10

(17) After Appendix Al, the following appendices shall be inserted, namely:—

APPENDIX- A1A
(See rules 5(1)(c), 19A(2))
APPLICATION FOR APPROVAL OF THE BUILDING SITE AND FOR THE
PERMISSION TO EXECUTE THE WORK.
Municipal ~ Corporation/Municipal

Council/Town Panchayat

1. Name in capital letters Applicant(s) Owner(s)

2. Address:

(i) Permanent address of the owner

(i1)) To which communications are to be sent
3. Nature of development/construction:

(1) New construction

(if) Reconstruction

(ii1) Alteration /Addition/Extension
(iv) Change in occupancy

4. Details of plot
(i) Revenue Village

(i) (a) Survey No.
(b) Resurvey No

(iii) Sub Division

(iv) Taluk

(v) District

(vi) Extent in Sq.m
(vil) Nature of ownership
(viii) Number and date of deed/ Document
(ix) Registrar's Office
(x)  Ward No.
(xi) Authorised number of the nearest building
(xi1) Nearest Electric Post/Telecom Post number
5. Whether the land, if any, contiguous to this plot
of the owner shown in the site plan (Rule 6(4)(a)(1)) : Yes /No

Thisisadigitaly signed Gazette.
Authenticity may be verified through https://compose.kerala.gov.in/




11

6. Usage of surrounding plots in general
North
East
South

West
7 . Whether Government or Quasi Government

&. Details of the Construction

(1) Details of Proposed Building(s)

Building no. 1 Building no. 2
Occupancy: Occupancy :
Height of the building - .............. m  [Height of the building - ............... m
Use (Built-up | Area Floor Use |Built-up Area Floor area
Floors area | provided | area area provided | (Sq.m.)
(Sq.m.) for (Sq.m.) (Sq.m.) |for parking
parking inside the
inside the building
building (Sq.m.)
(Sq.m.)
Basement
floor
Ground
floor
Total
Add separate sheet if required, duly signed by both the empaneled licensee and the Owner

(i1) Details of Existing Building(s)
Building no. 1

Building no. 2

Occupancy: Occupancy :
Height of the building - .............. m [Height of the building - ............... m
Use |Built-up | Area Floor Use |Built-up Area Floor area
Floors area | provided | area area provided | (Sq.m.)
(Sq.m.) for (Sq.m.) (Sq.m.) |for parking
parking inside the
inside the building
building (Sq.m.)
(Sq.m.)
Basement
floor

Thisisadigitaly signed Gazette.

Authenticity may be verified through https://compose.kerala.gov.in/




12

Ground
floor

Total

Add separate sheet if required, duly signed by both the empaneled licensee and the Owner
(ii1) Total Built-up Area
(iv) Total Covered Area
(v) Total parking area provided inside the bu11d1ng(s)
(vi) Total Floor Area
(vii) Estimated cost of construction :
9.  Basic KPBR Verification with respect to proposed plot

SI. | Rule |Description Required/permissible Provided
No. | No.

1 Access width to the plot

2 Coverage

3 Floor Space Index

10. Basic Kerala Municipality Building Rule Verification w.r.t. proposed building(s)
(a) Building no. 1

S1. No. |Rule No. Description Required/permissible Provided

1 Access width to the building (in
m)

2 Minimum distance from the
abutting road/access to other
building(s) (in metre)

3 INo. of Four-wheeler parking

4 Area of Two-wheeler parking

5 No. of Parking for Differently
abled

6 INo. of Parking for Visitors

7 Loading/unloading space (in sq.
metre)

8 Set Backs (in metre)

Front
Side 1
Side 2
Rear

9 Exit Width (in metre)

10 INo. of Stair case(s)

11 INo. of Fire Escape Stair case(s)

12 Rainwater storage capacity (in
litre)

Thisisadigitaly signed Gazette.
Authenticity may be verified through https://compose.kerala.gov.in/




13

13 connected load in kW for
buildings coming under rule 2.1
and 2.2 of KSECBC rules 2017

Add separate sheet if required, duly signed by both the licensee and the Owner
11. Provisions of Town Planning Schemes, if any, applicable to the construction
(i) Zoning

SI. Name of the TP Stage Zone Permissibility of proposed
No. Scheme (Sanctioned/ construction as per the scheme
Published)
(i1) Road Widenin
Set Back
Name of Stage E)flstmg Prgposed Building Required Set back
SI. ; Width of | Width of | . - from !
the TP (Sanctioned/ . . [Line (in|. .. provided
No. . road (in |road (in Existing road |* .
Scheme Published) m) (in m)
m) m) boundary
(in m)
12. Permissibility with respect to Kerala Conservation
of Paddy Land and Wet land Act 2008 / KLU order 1967:
(1) Type of land as per BTR
a) Type of land as per Data Bank
13. Details of permit/approved plan already obtained.
14. Details of fee paid: Application fee Layout scrutiny fee

(1) Amount
(i) No. and date of receipt
15. Details of documents, plans, certificate, etc. enclosed.

Thisisadigitaly signed Gazette.
Authenticity may be verified through https://compose.kerala.gov.in/




14

16. Details of NOC obtained.

Sl.  |Required 'Whether enclosed or not Details of the NOC / Clearances
No.

17. DECLARATION

hereby declare that the

measurements, specifications and other details mentioned above are correct, complete and true to
the best of my knowledge and belief and that I shall abide by the approved plan and the provisions
in the Kerala Municipality Act ,1994 and Kerala Municipality Building Rules ,2019 in
undertaking the construction.

Place:
Date:

18.

Signature of the owner with name

CERTIFICATE

Certified that the site plan is prepared after verification of ownership document and site and the
measurements shown are found to be correct.

Place:
Date:

19.

Signature:

Name:

Reg.No of Empanelled licensee.:
Address:

CERTIFICATE

Certified that the building plan is prepared in accordance with the provisions in the Kerala
Panchayth Building Rules 2019, Kerala Panchayath Raj Act, 1994 and the provisions contained in
the sanctioned Town Planning Schemes, if any.

Place:
Date:

Thisisadigitaly signed Gazette.

Authenticity may be verified through https://compose.kerala.gov.in/

Signature:

Name:

Reg.No of Empanelled licensee.:
Address:




15

20. UNDERTAKING

P hereby undertake that the building construction
and/or land development will be carried on/ being carried on/ was carried on as per the approved
plan and permit in accordance with the rules in force.

Place: Signature:

Date: Name:
Reg.No of Empanelled licensee.:
Address:

Thisisadigitaly signed Gazette.
Authenticity may be verified through https://compose.kerala.gov.in/




16

APPENDIX- A1B
(See rules 19A(2))
ACKNOWLEDGMENT RECEIPT

................................................................... Municipal  Corporation/Municipal

Details of application

1. Application No. :
Name of owner :
Reg no. of Empanelled licensee:
Occupancy of the proposed construction:
Floor area of the proposed construction:
Date of receipt of application:

o gk wnN

It is hereby acknowledged that the application for self certified building permit submitted by
Sri/Smt........ccooiiiiiiiiil has been received in this officeon .................

Name and Signature
Office seal Official Designation”

Thisisadigitaly signed Gazette.
Authenticity may be verified through https://compose.kerala.gov.in/




17

(18) After Appendix F2, the following appendix shall be inserted, namely:—

“APPENDIX F2A
[See rules 19C]

OCCUPANCY CERTIFICATE OR USE CERTIFICATE FOR LOW RISK BUILDINGS
CONSTRUCTED BY OBTAINING SELF CERTIFIED BUILDING PERMIT

.................................................................................... Municipal Corporation /
Municipal Council / Town Panchayat

Reference:  Completion report / Partial Completion report submitted by the owner (Name)
dated ..oooeieeiiie, and the empanelled licensee (Name & Reg. No.)

dated.........coooiiiiiiinl, issued 110 T PP and
SUPCIVISEA DY ..ttt e has been inspected by
me and that the work executed is in accordance with the permit and the building is now fit for
occupation/ use.

Place: Signature of the Secretary
Date:

Enclosure: Completion Plan (Seal)”

Thisisadigitaly signed Gazette.
Authenticity may be verified through https://compose.kerala.gov.in/




18

(19) After Appendix N, the following appendices shall be inserted namely:—

“ APPENDIX O
[See rule 19A(1), 19A(3)]
SELF-CERTIFIED BUILDING PERMIT
................................................................... Municipal Corporation/Municipal

Ref:— Application dated............................ from Sri./Smt. ...

This is the site approval and self-certified building permit for

construction/reconstruction/erection/re-erection/addition/alteration

building................oooil. (specify the construction) in building No........................
near the building No...................c......in Survey/Resurvey No. ...,
VIlage ... Taluk......ooooviii
DIStIICt. ..o for .o

(specify the occupancy) purpose subject to the conditions stated below:
(1) Adequate safety measures will be ensured for protection against damage to health, life,

buildings and property of the workers and inhabitants around, during and after building

construction. The owner and the developer shall be solely responsible for any such damages.

(a) Setbacks (m) (minimum & average)

Building 1 Front Rear Side Side-1 Side 2
Building 2 Front Rear Side Side-1 Side 2
Building 3 Front Rear Side Side-1 Side 2
(b)) Plot Area (sq m) :

(c) FSI : Coverage :

Thisisadigitaly signed Gazette.
Authenticity may be verified through https://compose.kerala.gov.in/




(d) Details of proposed building(s):

19

Signature of the owner

Building no. 1 Building no. 2
Occupancy of the building - Occupancy of the building -
Floors |Height of the building - m Height of the building - m
Built-up | Floor Carpet Built-up | Floor Carpet
Use area area area Use area area area
(Sg.m.) | (Sgq.m.) | (Sg.m.) (Sg.m.) |[(Sgq.m.) | (Sg.m.)
Basement
floor
Ground
floor
Total

Add separate sheet if required, duly signed by both the licensee and the Owner

(e) Date of commencement of Construction —
(f) Whether the proposed construction falls in any town planning Scheme/ plan
(g)Name and registration number of the empanelled licensee:

. The measurements, specifications and other details mentioned above are correct, complete
and true to the best of my knowledge and belief and I shall abide by the approved plan and
the provisions in the Act and Rules in undertaking the construction.

. The site plan is prepared after verification of ownership document and site and the
measurements shown are found to be correct.

. The plot and the proposed building conforms to the provisions of Coastal Zone Regulation
notification and Kerala Conservation of Paddy and Wetland Act 2008 and its subsequent
amendments.

. The building plan is prepared in accordance with the provisions in the Kerala Municipality
Building Rules 2019, the Kerala Municipality Act 1994, the provisions contained in the
sanctioned Town Planning Schemes, if any,and permission/NOC/concurrence, if any,
required as per Rule 5(4) of the Kerala Municipality Building Rules 2019.

Signature of the empanelled licensee

Name : Name:
Address: Reg. No.:
Date: Address:

Thisisadigitaly signed Gazette.
Authenticity may be verified through https://compose.kerala.gov.in/

(Empanelled Architect, Building Designer,
Engineer, Town Planner, Supervisor)

Date:




20

Encl:
1. Building plans, documents and other details as per Rule 6.

2. NOCs/Clearances (specify if any):
3. Others (specify):
The Self certified building permit is valid only along with the duly signed acknowledgment

receipt in Appendix A1B

Thisisadigitaly signed Gazette.
Authenticity may be verified through https://compose.kerala.gov.in/




21

Appendix P
(See rule 19D & 19E)

Plinth level Inspection Report

................................................................... Municipal Corporation/Municipal

A. General Details
1. Application No

2. Name and address of owner

3. Typeloccupancy

5. Name of the officer conducting the site inspection
6. Date of inspection
7. Stage of construction at site

B. Plinth level inspection Details

Sl Item Provided as per approved Provided actually at site
no plan

1 Distance from road R23(2)

2 |Front set back

3 |Rear set back

4 |Side set back

5 |Plinth area

8. Any other remarks
9. Number of photos enclosed -

Inspection is done inthe presence of ..o

Thisisadigitaly signed Gazette.
Authenticity may be verified through https://compose.kerala.gov.in/




22

| also assure and undertake that, I have signed in the plan and the construction made up to
plinth level is structurally safe and is in accordance to the building rules and other relevant
Act/Rules in force and is fit for continuing construction.

Encl: Building plans as specified in Rule 21 B Signature
Name:
Reg no./Empanelled no.:
Address:
Date:
Verification Report

(This form has to be completed and submitted to the Secretary by the officer inspecting the site
after his site inspection and verification regarding compliance of the structure up to plinth level
with the approved plan)

I. Work of ........... (Title of the project)........ at oo [ Site
address]..................

I1. Name of the present owner:

I11. Description of the structure:

IV. Whether the construction up to plinth level is as per the approved plan Yes/no
V. Remarks

V1. Recommendation

Name and Signature
Official Designation
........................................... Municipal Corporation/Municipal Council/Town

Thisisadigitaly signed Gazette.
Authenticity may be verified through https://compose.kerala.gov.in/




23

APPENDIX -Q
[See rule 99(7)]
Application for empanelment under the Kerala Municipality Building Rules, 2019
1. Name of registered Architect/ Building Designer/ Town Planner/Engineer/ Supervisor :

2. Permanent Address

3. Address to which communications
are to be sent

4. Registration details
(Attested copies of document showing valid
registration/recognition of Bachelor’s degree
course in Architecture from Council of
Architecture or that in Civil Engineering from
AICTE, COA registration as the case may be, should be enclosed)
6 References of previous licenses, if any
7  Details of show cause notices received/
cancellation of licenses, etc if any

DECLARATION

hereby declare
that the details furnished above are correct, complete and true to the best of my knowledge and
belief.

Signature: ........ooviiiiiiii

(Office seal)
Place:
Date:

By order of the Governor,

BISHWANATH SINHA,
Principal Secretary to Government.

Thisisadigitaly signed Gazette.
Authenticity may be verified through https://compose.kerala.gov.in/




24

Explanatory Note
(This does not form part of the notification, but is intended to indicate its general purport.)
As per Kerala Municipality (Second Amendment) Ordinance,2021 (Ordinance No. 34 of
2021) Government have introduced provision for issuing Acknowledgement certificate which
shall be deemed to be permission to execute the work of the construction/ reconstruction of low
risk buildings. In accordance with the provisions of Kerala Municipality Act,1994 (20 of 1994)
as amended by the said ordinance, Government have decided to amend the Kerala Panchayat

Building Rules, 2019. It is also decided to bring certain other amendment also in the Rules.

The notification is intended to achieve the above object.

PUBLISHED BY THE SUPERINTENDENT OF GOVERNMENT PRESSES
AT THE GOVERNMENT CENTRAL PRESS, THIRUVANANTHAPURAM, 2021 pme=

Thisisadigitaly signed Gazette.
Authenticity may be verified through https://compose.kerala.gov.in/




©
CHOE MBBOHID
Government of Kerala
2021

Regn.No. KERBIL/2012/45073
ated 05-09-2012 with RNI

Reg No.KL/TV (N)/634/2021-2023

CHOG NIV
KERALA GAZETTE

G VoWomeMo
EXTRAORDINARY

GRW®IQ1H2IW] (aIM]EDOA SO0

PUBLISHED BY AUTHORITY

® 1) UMD L) o, 2021 )6 29
29th June 2021
adelfo 10 92130 —
VoIJ; 1196 &flloymo 15 m“,\’fc‘? 1897
. Thiruvananthapuram, 15th Mithunam 1196
Tuesday 1943 @R MU0 8
8th Ashadha 1943

GOVERNMENT OF KERALA
Local Self Government (RD) Department

NOTIFICATION

G.0.(Ms.) No.120/2021/LSGD. Dated, Thiruvananthapuram, 28th June, 2021

14th Mithunam, 1196.

S.R. O. No. 482/2021 )
In exercise of the powers conferred under sections 235A, 235B, 235F, 235P, 235W, 235KA

read with section 254 of the Kerala Panchayat Raj Act, 1994 (Act 13 of 1994), the Government of
Kerala hereby make the following Rules further to amend the Kerala Panchayat Building Rules,
2019 issued under notification G.O. (P) No. 78/2019/LSGD. dated 2nd November, 2019 and

published as S.R.O. No. 829/2019 in the Kerala Gazette Extraordinary No. 2692 dated
8th November, 2019 namely:—

Thisisadigitaly signed Gazette.
Authenticity may be verified through https://compose.kerala.gov.in/




RULES

1. Short title and commencement.—(1) These Rules may be called the Kerala Panchayat
Building (Amendment) Rules, 2021.

(2) They shall come into force at once.

2. Amendment of the Rules.— In the Kerala Panchayat Building Rules, 2019,
(1) In rule 2, in sub-rule (1),—
(a) In clause (i), the following sentence shall be added after the words “duly
approved by the Secretary” namely:—
“It also includes self certified building permit along with the acknowledgment by

the Secretary”

(b) the following clause shall be inserted after clause (bn) namely:—

“(bna) 'low risk buildings' include residential buildings under Group A1 occupancy,
with built up area of less than three hundred square meters and height less than seven
meters and limited to two storeys, hostel, orphanage, dormetry, old age home, seminary
under Group A2 occupancy having built up area less than two hundred square meters,
educational buildings under Group B occupancy having built up area less than two
hundred square meters, Group D occupancy buildings where persons congregate for
religious and patriotic purposes having built up area less than two hundred square
meters, Group F occupancy buildings having built up area less than one hundred square
meters, Group G1 occupancy buildings without any nuisance and not dangerous and

"o

having built up area less than one hundred square meters

(c) the following clause shall be inserted after clause (ce) namely:—

“(cea) ‘Plinth level inspection’ is defined as the inspection at site as prescribed
when the construction reaches at the plinth level. In the case of pile foundation this
inspection is done at the stage where pile cap is completed. Plinth level inspection shall

be carried out for low risk buildings.”;

Thisisadigitaly signed Gazette.
Authenticity may be verified through https://compose.kerala.gov.in/




(d) the following clause shall be inserted after clause (cs) namely:—

“(csa) 'Self Certification' means self certification issued jointly by the owner of the
building and the empanelled licensee to the effect that, the building plan and site plan
for the construction or reconstruction of the low risk buildings, are in accordance with
the provisions of the Act and rules, for the time being in force, and any lawful direction

issued, any stipulation as to the standard of specifications, laws, rules and directions.”;

(2) In rule 3, in clause (e) of sub-rule (4) for the words “DTP Scheme”, the words,
“Detailed Town Planning Scheme” shall be substituted
(3) Inrule 4, for sub-rule (2) the following sub-rule shall be substituted namely:—

“(2) No person shall construct or reconstruct or make addition or extension or alteration to
any building or cause the same to be done without first obtaining a building permit from the
Secretary and in the case of low risk building without obtaining an Acknowledgment Receipt

which shall be deemed to be a permit from the Secretary;”

(4) Inrule5,
(i) insub-rule (1), after clause (b) the following shall be inserted, namely:—

“(c) to construct or reconstruct a low risk building or make alteration or addition or
extension or change in occupancy may file an application to the Secretary for approval of building
site and for permission to execute the work with self certification in Form in Appendix A1A along
with documents as specified in rule 19A:”

(i1) In the Table under sub-rule (4), against S1.No.5 in column (1), in column (3) under the
heading Officer/authority, for the words “District Collector”, the word “Panchayat™ shall be
substituted.

(5) In rule 10, in sub-rule (5), after the words “issue of permit”, the words “or self

certified building permit” shall be inserted;

Thisisadigitaly signed Gazette.
Authenticity may be verified through https://compose.kerala.gov.in/




(6) In Rule 12, for the words “thirty days”, the words “fifteen days” shall be
substituted.

(7) In Rule 13, for the words “thirty days”, the words “fifteen days” shall be
substituted.

(8) In Rule 14,
(@) insub-rule (1) for the words “thirty days”, the words “fifteen days” shall be substituted.

(b) in sub-rule (3) for the words “sixty clear days”, the words “forty five days” shall be

substituted;
(9) Inrule 15,

a)  insub-rule (1), after the words “building permit” the words “acknowledgment receipt

which shall be deemed to be permit” shall be inserted;

b)  in sub-rule (2), after the words “five years”, the following sentence shall be added,

namely:-

“In the case of acknowledgment certificate which shall be deemed to be permit the intention
to extend the permit for another five years is to be intimated by a letter signed by the owner

and empanelled licensee to the Secretary.”;

(c) in sub-rule (4), after the words “ten years”, the following sentence shall be added
namely:—

“In the case of acknowledgment certificate which shall be deemed to be permit the
intention to renew the same for another five years is to be intimated by a letter signed by

the owner and empanelled licensee to the Secretary.”;
(10) After the rule 19, the following rules shall be inserted namely

“19A Procedure for grant of acknowledgment certificate.-(1)In the case of low risk

buildings application shall be submitted to the Secretary with the application fee and permit fee,
along with Self certification in Appendix A1A, self certified building permit in Appendix O along

with the documents specified in sub-rule (1) of rule 5 of these rules.

Thisisadigitaly signed Gazette.
Authenticity may be verified through https://compose.kerala.gov.in/




(2) On receipt of the application in Appendix A1A under sub-rule (1) complete in all
respects the Secretary shall within five working days issue an Acknowledgment Certificate in
Appendix A1B.

(3) The applicant may commence construction from the date of commencement of
construction mentioned in the self certified building permit in Appendix O. All plans submitted

shall be certified by the empanelled licensee as given in Appendix J1.

(4) Clearances and NOCs from any authorities concerned required under these rules or any

other relevant Act or Rules shall be submitted along with the application.

(5) Constructions which involve excavations to a depth of more than 1.5 metres are not

eligible for acknowledgment receipt.

“19B. Other conditions pertaining to self certification.

(1) At any stage of construction of low risk buildings, if the empanelled licensee
who issued self certified building permit, notices that such building is being
constructed in violation of such building plan, empanelled licensee shall intimate
to the authority concerned regarding such violations and stop further supervision.
The empanelled licensee shall submit complete details along with photographs of

the building being constructed to the concerned authority;

(2) The Secretary shall immediately issue a notice to the owner on the basis of the
intimation received from the empanelled licensee to suspend further work and rectify
violations. In such cases the owner shall not make further additions in violation of the
conditions. The owner may, after removal of violations, engage an emapanelled
licensee for preparing the revised drawings for obtaining revised self certified building
permit. In such cases occupancy certificate shall be given only after scrutiny of revised

self certified building permit and inspection of site;

Thisisadigitaly signed Gazette.
Authenticity may be verified through https://compose.kerala.gov.in/




(3) After submission of application or during the construction of building if there is
change in the owner or the empanelled licensee, the person concerned shall intimate
the Secretary in writing or through online building plan approval system that he is no
longer responsible for the construction project from the date of receipt of the
intimation. The information must be sent within seven days of occurrence of the
change to the Secretary by the respective owner/ empanelled licensee. The
construction work shall have to be suspended until the new owner / empanelled
licensee, as the case may be, undertake the full responsibility of the project by

submitting in writing to the Secretary intimating the same.

(4) Secretary or any other person authorized reserves the right to check the building plans
and construction at any stage and violations, if found shall have to be rectified by the owner.
In case the owner fail to rectify violations, the Secretary shall take necessary steps to rectify

the violations.

19C. Issue of occupancy certificate. After the completion of the construction of the building as

per the self certified building permit, the occupancy certificate shall be issued in form Appendix
F2A.

19D. Procedure for plinth level inspection for low risk buildings.—In the case of Low risk

buildings the empanelled licensee shall conduct plinth level inspection and shall submit the
Inspection Report, in Appendix P to the Secretary. The Secretary or the officer authorized by him
may offer remarks on Appendix P submitted by the empanelled licensee and inform the same
along with the observed deviation or objection, if any, to the owner within five days from the date
of receipt of such intimation. The following documents shall be submitted along with

Appendix P:

(i) Building plans indicating the plinth constructed at site in relation to the plot

dimensions, area and setbacks, duly signed by the owner and empanelled licensee.

(i1) Signed photograph (s) with date showing construction up to plinth level at site.

Thisisadigitaly signed Gazette.
Authenticity may be verified through https://compose.kerala.gov.in/




19E. Procedure for plinth level inspection for all other buildings. (1) In case of all other

buildings, on completion of work up to plinth level, the owner, through his registered Architect/
Institution/ Building Designer/ Town Planner/ Engineer/ Supervisor, shall submit an intimation of
such completion in Appendix P to the Secretary to enable the Secretary or the person authorized
by him to verify that the work conforms to the approved plans and building bye-laws and relevant
Acts and Rules. After plinth level inspection the Secretary or the person authorized by him shall
offer remarks on Appendix P submitted by the registered Architect/ Institution/ Building Designer/
Town Planner/ Engineer/ Supervisor and inform the same along with the observed deviation or
objection, if any, to the owner within 5 days from the receipt of such intimation. The following

documents shall be submitted along with the intimation, namely:-

i) Building plans indicating the plinth constructed at site in relation to the plot
dimensions, area and setbacks, duly signed by the owner and registered Architect/

Institution/ Building Designer/ Town Planner/ Engineer/ Supervisor.

i) Signed photograph(s) with date showing construction up to plinth level at site.

(2) No further construction shall be continued without the submission of plinth level

inspection report.

19F. Deemed completion of plinth level inspection.— In case the owner who submitted the

intimation on plinth level inspection receives no communication from the Secretary within 7 days
of such intimation, plinth level inspection shall be deemed to have been completed without any
deviation having been noticed. It shall be the responsibility of the owner / Empanelled licensee /
registered Architect/ Institution/ Building Designer/ Town Planner/ Engineer/ Supervisor to ensure

that the building is constructed in accordance with the approved plan.
(112) Inrule 25, in sub-rule 2,

in clause (1), for the words “Fire and Rescue Department”, the words “Department of Fire
and Rescue Services” shall be substituted;

(12) Inrule 28, in sub-rule (1),

Thisisadigitaly signed Gazette.
Authenticity may be verified through https://compose.kerala.gov.in/




a) In the twelfth proviso and thirteenth proviso, for the words “total built up area” the

words “total floor area” shall be substituted;

b) In sub-rule (2) and sub-rule (3), for the words “total built up area” the words “total

floor area” shall be substituted;
c) after the fourteenth proviso, the following proviso shall be inserted, namely:—

“Provided also that in the case of buildings intended for the storage of LPG cylinders
designated as white category as per the norms of the Pollution Control Board, the access

width shall not be less than 6 metres.”;
(13) In rule 43, after sub-rule (2) the following sub-rules shall be inserted, namely:—

“(3) Provision for LPG piped gas system/ LPG articulate system shall be provided in all

apartments with adequate safety measures.

(4) In the case of existing apartments, provision for LPG piped gas system/ LPG articulate
system shall be provided within 3 years of the date of commencement of the Kerala Panchayat
Building (Amendment) Rules, 2021.”;

(14) In rule 49, in sub-rule (1), in clause (i) for the words and figures “item (xi)”, the words

and figures “item (xii)” shall be substituted;

(15) In rule 52, for the words “Social Welfare Department”, the words “Social Justice

Department” shall be substituted;

(16) In Rule 99, the following sub-rule shall be inserted, namely:—

“(7) For providing self certified building permit, a registered Architect/ Institution/
Building Designer/ Town Planner/ Engineer/ Supervisor shall empanel with the registering
authority and shall submit an application in Appendix Q for empanelment. All empanelled

licensees shall undergo training as specified by Government from time to time.

Thisisadigitaly signed Gazette.
Authenticity may be verified through https://compose.kerala.gov.in/




The fee for empanelment shall be the rates shown below:

Architect : Rs 12000
Building Designer A : Rs 12000
Building Designer B : Rs 10000
Engineer A : Rs 12000
Engineer B : Rs 10000
Town Planner A : Rs 12000
Town Planner B : Rs 10000
Supervisor Senior : Rs 8000

Supervisor A : Rs 6000

Supervisor B : Rs 4000~

Amendment of Appendixes.

(17) In Appendix Al,
(1) In SI. No. 9, for the letters, ’KMBR” the letters and figures “KPBR 2019 shall be
substituted;

(2) in the table under SI. No. 10, the following item shall be added as SI. No. 13

namely:—

“connected load in kW for buildings coming under rule 2.1 and 2.2 of Kerala State

Energy Conservation Building Code Rules 2017”

Thisisadigitaly signed Gazette.
Authenticity may be verified through https://compose.kerala.gov.in/




10

(18) After Appendix Al, the following appendices shall be inserted, namely:—

“APPENDIX- A1A
(See rules 5(1)(c), 19A(2))

APPLICATION FOR APPROVAL OF THE BUILDIING SITE AND FOR THE
PERMISSION TO EXECUTE THE WORK.

1. Name in capital letters

2. Address:
(i) Permanent address of the

owner :
(i1)) To which communications are to be sent

3. Nature of development/construction:
(i) New construction

(i1) Reconstruction

(111) Alteration /Addition/Extension
(iv) Change in occupancy

4. Details of plot
(i) Revenue Village
(i) (a) Survey No.
(b) Resurvey No
(iii) Sub Division
(iv) Taluk
(v) District

(vi) Extent in Sq.m

(vii) Nature of ownership

(viil) Number and date of deed/ Document

(ix) Registrar's Office

(x)  Ward No.

(xi) Authorised number of the nearest building
(xi1) Nearest Electric Post/Telecom Post number

5. Whether the land, if any, contiguous to this plot
of the owner shown in the site plan (Rule 6(4)(a)(i))

Thisisadigitaly signed Gazette.
Authenticity may be verified through https://compose.kerala.gov.in/

Panchayat

Applicant(s) Owner(s)

: Yes /No




11

6. Usage of surrounding plots in general

North
East
South
West

7 . Whether Government or Quasi Government
8. Details of the Construction

(1) Details of Proposed Building(s)

Building no. 1 Building no. 2
Occupancy: Occupancy :
Height of the building - .............. m |Height of the building - ............... m
Use |Built-up | Area Floor Use |Built-up Area Floor area
Floors area |provided | area area  [provided for | (Sq.m.)
(Sq.m.) for (Sq.m.) (Sq.m.) | parking
parking inside the
inside the building
building (Sq.m.)
(Sq.m.)
Basement
floor
Ground
floor
Total
Add separate sheet if required, duly signed by both the empaneled licensee and the Owner
(i1) Details of Existing Building(s)
Building no. 1 Building no. 2
Occupancy: Occupancy :
Height of the building - .............. m [Height of the building - ............... m
Use |Built-up | Area Floor Use |Built-up Area Floor area
Floors area | provided | area area [provided for | (Sq.m.)
(Sq.m.) for (Sq.m.) (Sq.m.) | parking
parking inside the
inside the building
building (Sq.m.)
(Sq.m.)
Basement
floor

Thisisadigitaly signed Gazette.

Authenticity may be verified through https://compose.kerala.gov.in/




12

Ground
floor

Total

Add separate sheet if required, duly signed by both the empaneled licensee and the Owner
(ii1) Total Built-up Area
(iv) Total Covered Area
(v) Total parking area provided inside the bu11d1ng(s)
(vi) Total Floor Area
(vii) Estimated cost of construction :
9.  Basic KPBR Verification with respect to proposed plot

SI. | Rule |Description Required/permissible Provided
No. | No.
1 Access width to the plot
2 Coverage
3 Floor Space Index
10. Basic Kerala Panchayat Building Rule Verification w.r.t. proposed building(s)
(a) Building no. 1
S1. No. |Rule No. Description Required/permissible Provided
1 )Access width to the building (in
m)
2 Minimum distance from the
abutting road/access to other
building(s) (in metre)
3 INo. of Four-wheeler parking
4 Area of Two-wheeler parking
5 No. of Parking for Differently
abled
6 No. of Parking for Visitors
7 Loading/unloading space (in sq.
metre)
8 Set Backs (in metre)
Front
Side 1
Side 2
Rear
9 Exit Width (in metre)
10 INo. of Stair case(s)
11 INo. of Fire Escape Stair case(s)
12 Rainwater storage capacity (in
litre)

Thisisadigitaly signed Gazette.
Authenticity may be verified through https://compose.kerala.gov.in/




13

13

connected load in kW for
buildings coming under rule 2.1
and 2.2 of KSECBC rules 2017

Add separate sheet if required, duly signed by both the licensee and the Owner
11. Provisions of Town Planning Schemes, if any, applicable to the construction

1) Zoning
SI. Name of the TP Stage Zone Permissibility of proposed
No. Scheme (Sanctioned/ construction as per the scheme
Published)
(i1) Road Widenin
Set Back
Name of Stage E)?ls‘[mg Prgposed Building Required Set back
S1. ; Width of | Width of | . ; from .
the TP (Sanctioned/ . . [Line (in|, . . provided
No. . road (in |road (in Existing road | .
Scheme Published) m) (in m)
m) m) boundary
(in m)

12. Permissibility with respect to Kerala Conservation
of Paddy Land and Wet and Act 2008 / KLU order 1967 :

(i)

Type of land as per BTR
a) Type of land as per Data Bank

13. Details of permit/approved plan already obtained.
14. Details of fee paid:
(i) Amount

(if) No. and date of receipt

15.

Thisisadigitaly signed Gazette.
Authenticity may be verified through https://compose.kerala.gov.in/

Application fee

Details of documents, plans, certificate, etc. enclosed.

Layout scrutiny fee




14

16. Details of NOC obtained.
Sl.  |Required 'Whether enclosed or not Details of the NOC / Clearances
No.
17. DECLARATION
PP hereby declare

that the measurements, specifications and other details mentioned above are correct, complete and
true to the best of my knowledge and belief and that I shall abide by the approved plan and the
provisions in the Kerala Panchayat Raj Act ,1994 and Kerala Panchayat Building Rules ,2019
Rules in undertaking the construction.

Place:

Date:

18.

Signature of the owner with name

CERTIFICATE

Certified that the site plan is prepared after verification of ownership document and site
and the measurements shown are found to be correct.

Place:

Date:

19.

Signature:

Name:

Reg. No. of Empanelled licensee:
Address:

CERTIFICATE

Certified that the building plan is prepared in accordance with the provisions in the Kerala
Panchayth Building Rules 2019, Kerala Panchayath Raj Act, 1994 and the provisions contained in
the sanctioned Town Planning Schemes, if any.

Place:

Date:

Thisisadigitaly signed Gazette.

Authenticity may be verified through https://compose.kerala.gov.in/

Signature:

Name:

Reg. No. of Empanelled licensee:
Address:




15

20. UNDERTAKING

hereby undertake that the building
construction and/or land development will be carried on/ being carried on/ was carried on as per
the approved plan and permit in accordance with the rules in force.

Place: Signature:

Date: Name:
Reg. No. of Empanelled licensee:
Address:

Thisisadigitaly signed Gazette.
Authenticity may be verified through https://compose.kerala.gov.in/




16

APPENDIX- A1B
(See rules 19A(2))
ACKNOWLEDGMENT RECEIPT

Details of application

1. Application No. :
Name of owner :
Reg no. of Empanelled licensee:
Occupancy of the proposed construction:
Floor area of the proposed construction:
Date of receipt of application:

o s wN

It is hereby acknowledged that the application for self certified building permit submitted by
Sri/Smt.........coooiiiiiiil has been received in this officeon .................

Name and Signature
Office seal Official Designation”

Thisisadigitaly signed Gazette.
Authenticity may be verified through https://compose.kerala.gov.in/




17

(19) After Appendix F2, the following appendix shall be inserted, namely:-

“APPENDIX F2A
[See rules 19C]

OCCUPANCY CERTIFICATE OR USE CERTIFICATE FOR LOW RISK BUILDINGS
CONSTRUCTED BY OBTAINING SELF CERTIFIED BUILDING PERMIT

.................................................................................... Municipal Corporation /
Municipal Council / Town Panchayat

Reference:  Completion report / Partial Completion report submitted by the owner (Name)
dated ...cooeeiiiiie, and the empanelled licensee (Name & Reg. No.)

Certified that the construction or reconstruction or addition or alteration of building or
erection of work under the self certified building permit No................

110 PP and supervised

) has been inspected by me and that
the work executed is in accordance with the permit and the building is now fit for occupation/ use.

Place: Signature of the Secretary
Date:

Enclosure: Completion Plan (Seal)”

Thisisadigitaly signed Gazette.
Authenticity may be verified through https://compose.kerala.gov.in/




18

(20) After Appendix N, the following appendices shall be inserted namely:—

“ APPENDIX O
[See rule 19A(1), 19A(3)]
SELF-CERTIFIED BUILDING PERMIT
................................................................... Panchayat

Ref:— Application dated............................ from Sri./Smt. ...

This is the site approval and self-certified building permit for the

construction/reconstruction/erection/re-erection/addition/alteration of building.....................

(specify the construction) in building No. ...l or near the
building No..............covvivvieeeeee N Survey/Resurvey NO...ooiiccceceee
Village......ccooovvvviniiinnnn.. Taluk......ooooiiii District..................
.............................. for........ooiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiieeeeee... (specify  the  occupancy)

purpose subject to the conditions stated below:
(1) Adequate safety measures will be ensured for protection against damage to health, life,
buildings and property of the workers and inhabitants around, during and after building

construction. The owner and the developer shall be solely responsible for any such damages.

(3]t t e

(B) o

(a) Setbacks (m) (minimum & average)

Building 1 Front Rear Side Side -1 Side 2
Building 2 Front Rear Side Side-1 Side 2
Building 3 Front Rear Side Side-1 Side 2
(b)) Plot Area (sq m) :

(c) FSI : Coverage :

(d) Details of proposed building(s):

Thisisadigitaly signed Gazette.
Authenticity may be verified through https://compose.kerala.gov.in/




19

Building no. 1 Building no. 2
Occupancy of the building - Occupancy of the building -
Floors |Height of the building - m Height of the building - m
Built-up | Floor Carpet Built-up | Floor Carpet
Use area area area Use area area area
(Sg.m.) | (Sg.m.) | (Sq.m.) (Sg.m.) [(Sq.m.) | (Sg.m.)
Basement
floor
Ground
floor
Total

Add separate sheet if required, duly signed by both the licensee and the Owner

(e) Date of commencement of Construction —
() Whether the proposed construction falls in any town planning Scheme/ plan
(g)Name and registration number of the empanelled licensee:

1. The measurements, specifications and other details mentioned above are correct, complete
and true to the best of my knowledge and belief and | shall abide by the approved plan and
the provisions in the Act and Rules in undertaking the construction.

2. The site plan is prepared after verification of ownership document and site and the

measurements shown are found to be correct.

3. The plot and the proposed building conforms to the provisions of Coastal Zone
Regulation notification and Kerala Conservation of Paddy and Wetland Act 2008 and its
subsequent amendments.

4. The building plan is prepared in accordance with the provisions in the Kerala Panchayat

Building Rules 2019, the Kerala Panchayat Raj Act 1994, the provisions contained in the

sanctioned Town Planning Schemes, if any, and permission/NOC/concurrence, if any, required as

per Rule 5(4) of the Kerala Panchayat Building Rules 2019.

Signature of the owner Signature of the empanelled licensee
Name : Name:
Address: Reg. No.:

Thisisadigitaly signed Gazette.
Authenticity may be verified through https://compose.kerala.gov.in/




20

Date: Address:
(Empanelled Architect, Building Designer,
Engineer, Town Planner, Supervisor)
Date:

Encl:

=

Building plans, documents and other details as per Rule 6.
2. NOCs/Clearances (specify if any):
Others (specify):

w

The Self certified building permit is valid only along with the duly signed acknowledgment
receipt in Appendix A1B

Thisisadigitaly signed Gazette.
Authenticity may be verified through https://compose.kerala.gov.in/




21

Appendix P
(See rule 19D & 19E)

Plinth level Inspection Report

................................................................... Panchayat
NO. e Dated....................l.
A. General Details
1. Application No.
2. Name and address of owner
3. Typeloccupancy
4, SY.NO. ..o village..........cooeini local body.........covvvniinnna.n.

5. Name of the officer conducting the site inspection
6. Date of inspection
7. Stage of construction at site

B. Plinth level inspection Details

Sl Item Provided as per approved Provided actually at site
No. plan
Distance from road R23(2)

1

2  |Front set back
3 |Rear set back
4

5

Side set back

Plinth area

8. Any other remarks
9. Number of photos enclosed -
Inspection is done in the presence of ...........cooviiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiin

| also assure and undertake that, I have signed in the plan and the construction made up to
plinth level is structurally safe and is in accordance to the building rules and other relevant
Act/Rules in force and is fit for continuing construction.

Thisisadigitaly signed Gazette.
Authenticity may be verified through https://compose.kerala.gov.in/




22

Encl: Building plans as specified in Rule 21 B Signature
Name:
Reg No./Empanelled No.:
Address:
Date:
Verification Report

(This form has to be completed and submitted to the Secretary by the officer inspecting the site
after his site inspection and verification regarding compliance of the structure up to plinth level
with the approved plan)

I. Work of ........... (Title of the project)........ at oo e [ St
address]..................

I1. Name of the present owner:

I11. Description of the structure:

IV. Whether the construction up to plinth level is as per the approved plan Yes/no
V. Remarks

VI. Recommendation

Name and Signature
Official Designation
........................................... Panchayat

Thisisadigitaly signed Gazette.
Authenticity may be verified through https://compose.kerala.gov.in/




23

APPENDIX -Q
[See rule 99(7)]

Application for empanelment under the Kerala Panchayat Building Rules, 2019

=

Name of registered Architect/ Building Designer/ Town Planner/Engineer/ Supervisor :

no

Permanent Address

3. Address to which communications
are to be sent

4. Registration details
(Attested copies of document showing valid
registration/recognition of Bachelor’s degree
course in Architecture from Council of
Architecture or that in Civil Engineering from
AICTE, COA registration as the case may be, should be enclosed)
6. References of previous licenses, if any
7. Details of show cause notices received/
cancellation of licenses, etc if any

DECLARATION

O hereby declare
that the details furnished above are correct, complete and true to the best of my knowledge and
belief.

Signature: ..........ccoiiiiiiiii
Name:.....cooeii
Designation:..........ccooeiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiaann.
(Office seal)
Place:
Date:

By order of the Governor,

BISHWANATH SINHA,
Principal Secretary to Government.

Thisisadigitaly signed Gazette.
Authenticity may be verified through https://compose.kerala.gov.in/




24

Explanatory Note
(This does not form part of the notification, but is intended to indicate its general purport.)
As per Kerala Panchayat Raj (Second Amendment) Ordinance, 2021 (Ordinance No. 33 of
2021) Government have introduced provision for issuing Acknowledgement certificate which
shall be deemed to be permission to execute the work of the construction/reconstruction of low
risk buildings. In accordance with the provisions of Kerala Panchayat Raj Act, 1994 (13 of 1994)
as amended by the said ordinance, Government have decided to amend the Kerala Panchayat

Building Rules, 2019. It is also decided to bring certain other amendment also in the Rules.

The notification is intended to achieve the above object.

PUBLISHED BY THE SUPERINTENDENT OF GOVERNMENT PRESSES
AT THE GOVERNMENT CENTRAL PRESS, THIRUVANANTHAPURAM, 2021 pra=sze

Thisisadigitaly signed Gazette.
Authenticity may be verified through https://compose.kerala.gov.in/




n.9.(&66) Mo.85/2023/LSGD
.

"@EEMEIS+ BIQEIH"

@EER TLIWo BEEM Qldial - MEGRIVIWRGEM TLNIAIMEEBREI™ VSIEBMN OGBSI
dldaaoem  eaIddly  admy/@reaiemo admi/mpsa admy” agarlaiQes  aflossy
al@log@la] pEmEAl ajoajgalenmo.

@EZUR NI BEEM (ERBag)) Qldal

M.9.(68d) Me.85/2023/LSGD @il @, dl@aimamaj@e, 31-03-2023

oomoql
2019 eel coeg alrpan gammiaoeld eeds aldamosm agmrgdlcd @NoG?o
mw&uﬁ-l, ansm.tséuﬁ-ll evnsawéo'a-lll (@JH0®o aﬂum@l.ﬂggg @RGS0 odlmy” {Application
Fee - algo 5(1),15(6),70(4), 74(3),75(4),94 }, aildamoem &alddlg adlmy’ (Permit Fee - 9(4),
56(3), 70(7), 74(3), 75(4)}, cemog «mqmeﬂﬁo@g aggsm’l adlmy  -a150 5(6)(2)
agmriies aless) 0ee0almaow] aldaydasmaila) madeod olaaoy.

2. @@ muoanaleyETI@, 2019 erl CHESI e /gadmiapeld ogls
MlBao6mM 2ISEERUY (IR MERUWD (TNVIMe BEEM MUNIaIMEEREI®d mleinlmd gosossm
@RGS0 admy, eaddy oday, camog mqmeﬂn@g@ nggsmﬂ admy agomlauges
e 4SO algle:  (@@0ee 10/04/2023 dloe]  @osnueyowiled  al@laydla]
2omEAL oj0sglEamo.

@RealBH0 adlmy (KPBR/KMBR, 2019 SCHEDULE-1)

@E3UMUNIaiMe L S

: i100 SQ mt 101-300 SQ mt 1300 SQ mt a¥

| UGEWSES QEEQSS godc ose

' OSISEERUD O SlseBRUd edslseanud

WID AUV @300 @l 1000 @al 3000 @al

‘tgﬂaﬂlﬂqdadg] ) 373007@0,1 "IOOO_@-nJ - _ _4000 -@n.l

0B E0auD 300 @l 1000 @l 5000 @al
QnJ(BLﬁIQ' admy’ (KPBR/KMBR ,2019 SCHEDULE-I)

lETRIOQ DY 81150/ M= 151300/ m2 300 sgmt m@

Qagilmd




TL.9.(6:68) Mo.85/2023/LSGD

@20(TVo 50 @al / M2 100 @al / M2 150 @al / M2
| |
| B S S RN
QIQUMIOWe (DRJIBM 50 @at / M2 100 @t / M2 150@3ad / M2
casel) ' | '
‘ |
Quosilmye ‘70 @l / M2 150 @l /M2 200@al / M2
| i | o |
agesal 50 @ad / m2 100 @t / M2 150 @l / M2 i
admilajoeid !81—150/ me 151300/ m2 300sq.mt goglad |
RIrE ‘70 Bl /m? 120 @ Jm? 200 @al /m? ‘
\ |
QUAIMIOE. (DRJoBM 70 @t im? 120 @ /M2 200 @al /m?
coeuel) | _ - |
| 4 ,
QuoeTTilgaye ‘90 @l /m? 150 @al /m? 250 @al /m?
ageaal }70 (] /m? 120 @ /m? !200 (@l /m?P |
1
! 1l . | S S
C20BaC0nHD 81150 / m2 51300 / m2  300sq.mt @engiia
DRAMa 100 @l jm? 150 @3l /m? 200 @al /m?
QUAITVO®o (DBIOBM 450 gy /M2 150 @l /M2 200 (@l im?
coeuel) |
auoeniiele 100 @t /m? (170 @as /M 300 @at im°
agesq! 100 @ /m? !150 @l /m? !200 @Bl /m?
caigDg @jarilngs apsml admy (KPBR/KMBR,2019 SCHEDULE-)
g ay
&omamuiad Odglsolen meo adabla]lesm aloss
1 @D @RYUWITTIPEB Rs. 3/sq mt
2 QIQIMIIWo Rs. 4/sq mt




J.9.(56)6) Mo.85/2023/LSGD

-

3 Quosmlmye ' Rs. 4/sq mt

4 20880 Rs. 3/sq mt

3. ca®@ aladly @@ aldlydly adlmy dless) 9uleEdIss gl CHRB
alsap@o/gailmilaoeld  eagls  dldmosm  algsmBgod @RYAURPIW  CRBUNMI
QD IM@OETT.

(nademes DOmEQIM «)@w®o)
GOWI. A8 cadl eROMUAd
eJBmdloy@d eaugsdl
1) @Blnjmd (Wwwogd, mEqUe TLIWe BEREM Ak , TITBAUIMADJ@o.
2) (WORAB, MEGUR MLIs BEEM (GOM@) Qldsal, GIBAUMAMay@o.
3) cwamo:%ra, @EGFUR Mo BREM ( @RAENIM) Qldsal, ONBUMN D @o.
4) geuy MWEIMY@SB, EIBAUMIM@o.
5) allad 506 oM@ (Qlladeiday) |, ElEAMIDa@o.
6) aggJo MBERWD MLIWEEEEM  (TMUNAIM EXTV(EGSCIB0BER. (NMWES WROLA Gesum)
6) ageyp &gy (Q0@d / @rA@ed) cm0dl AWOHAROBER. (UTWE]5 WO
Qeeum)

7) 0 gdlejo sDEM loMABERo ( allad SVEM qjomA@ geaim)
8 ﬁl@gor WA, pBandeacum cHog dlayd , EIBAUMMao.

9) pBanBeanud & alenlles dlealaumdmy aldq] /oaini& my dodl@ (nwaemdeadd
exmvemudad miale:deasmailmowl)
10) @JBmilajm @perDeRd@ @momd (soaulgiaondg), eaos
OI@BUM D a)@o.
1) WNBIRY QUa]
2)doa aiga]
13) ag)glo MeEgue LI @EEM (]Jcﬂ:qd‘ﬁa(fac&ﬁ
14) 6o an@@3/ Boadlmy’ ed0a]
oomEQIM (@00
Signed by
PriyaS A
DAeeH0d 32023Me®8:02

ma;@‘ﬂ‘





