Regn.No. KERBIL/2012/45073
ated 05-09-2012 with RNI

Reg No.KL/TV (N)/634/2021-2023

©
CHOE MBBOHID
Government of Kerala
2021

CHOG NIV

KERALA GAZETTE

G VoWImeMo
EXTRAORDINARY

GRW1SI018H00®] (nIM1RVe]S)EmMOY

PUBLISHED BY AUTHORITY

®1) UMD L) @0, 2021 @RV 25
NLWd 25th August 2021
m\ielU;m ¢ 1197 2/levB0 9 m“,\’fc? 2469
ol. Thiruvananthapuram, Sth Chingam 1197
Wednesday 1943 BJ(Bo0 3
3rd Bhadra 1943
CHO8 MVABHHID
wl@a (Plwa Mldanrem-ail) aidia ]
Qll226mdalMo

MNIB 9559/0e105.m12/2020/Bl@ao. @l030Ima 00, 2021 @RNGY 24
1197 afletrzo 8
1943 =o@30 2.

2021 @Y 23-00 GG 6608 NAIGERNA Qil8oeNIN6N|SIOBI @IS alO@YIN
&3SIMMMY e lomERMEBRE81Ss @RAlAIlERISID] DGIMI@ (@ IMSIRLEN|SICmIIM].
NAIBERROIOS 2OMOQIMB (18000,

all. a0@l MIWA,
mla 6V 50l

Thisisadigitaly signed Gazette.
Authenticity may be verified through https.//compose.kerala.gov.in/




2021-9e1 129-00 MMIA 6323l

2021-081 608 DM, 30QUSS], ®% ©®I¥1e108] UMW (6BEWO)

&390l

@0® OlojeRfleslend  ag)$lelOiloensde  TVOAICNVOODI@  BHO8  WAIBGRNA

Qilgoenioee ]SO @).

1998-6£1 808 DQ, BI53AUSS], MY H®IYIEI08] ce:UAMIW] BB

6RAVDI aIgRMO®IMI8s
&30}
a303alonad

aflole,—2020-0e1 6508 Mg, &oUsE, ©®¢ emivlengl esuamluwl
(663L®I) a30dlmadM (2020-0e1 37) 2020 =o)Ll 3-00 GIG GHO8 NAIAHRHA
Qilgoenioes;omlloym @lmoelo;

2020 @MY 2490 Ol 62BN GHO8  TMVMRAIM  MIWATVEIHS
MLCIASMNGILIOD (EITIM® &30AAIMMAVINT ald0o MoNIM MIWAMVEIHS G0}
@B OBMZAUOMBIMB8 6303 enilad MlwaaveId @PAIMGlelesmalmyo
aIOQRIBNMMIMYo Bl @IMoeIo;

@INO® &a3almadmileel aljaInunsud mleimldomam@lmnol 2020-0.1 6608
DD, 03188, ™ 6®I%leNgl seunmIW] (6eELMI) sddIMMaY (2020-ee1 65)
2020 0aiqoeni@ 26-00 GG 6608 NAIGERHA Qillgoenioeq |SyOmIaloMm@Imoelo;

2020 allavoenid 31-00 G| G2IBMM GHOS ALOMVLNIM MIVWAMVEWIHS
amemsmomlee 2021 Mol 8-00 BI® @YOoEla] 2021 23mMaIdl 22-00 IO
@OQINVOM2ORAOW EHOS MMNIM MIVANVE@OS TVEIASMOMIL0 (@ISO
&03UIMAMilMiald:®o MeMNIM MIATVE@IAS B0} BYBQ BBIENBNUVMBIMSS
630} enil@d mlameclcd @AMl flesymalmyo aIOOBM@IMYo
Slomloymmlmoelo;

@INV@® &3almadmileel aljainunsdud Mleimldomim @lmoil 2021-6e1 66,08
DD, $053USE], @9 OMISIeNsl UMWl (6cEVGI) sodalmmm’ (2021-ee1 16)
2021 eanEnRIA] 9-00 BlOG 6308 NAIGERA Qilgoenioeqsyomlailom@lmoel)o;

Thisisadigitaly signed Gazette.
Authenticity may be verified through https.//compose.kerala.gov.in/




2021 6@ 24-00 GIO®] @YOoEla] 2021 233613 10-00 BN @OQITVIM,] 608
MVOMNOM  MIATVE@IOS AVEIASMEILIOD  (EIMN®}®  BIBAWINMIVIA  aldoo
MoMNIM MIWAMVEWHS &0} CBBY  OGIENUOMDINMS8 8303  enilad
W@aMEDI@ ERAIMGlQ{leemM@IMie aldqOBHMTIMIe dSl@OMIyM@IMmoeRo;

EINV®® sadlmmavleel alnImne:ud Mleimldomm@moell 2021-ee1 508
Do, 03188, ™ 6®I%leNg] seUnMIW] (6cELMI) sdIMMaY (2021-ee1 75)
2021 =396e1 1-00 D] 66:08 NIBEMNA allgoeninee|s;OmIloM GIMoeo;

2021 mjeeel 22-00 DG @YOoEle] 2021 @RWAY 13-00 GG @AMV
GHOS MoMNIM MIWATVE@IHS MVEIASMEILIOND) (IO &IAWIMMIVIAY ald:0o0
MoMNIM MIAMVEWES &0} COBY  ©GINZRUOMDINMS8 803  enilad
Tloacel@d @AmGlo{leam@Im]o aldq@ReM@IMIe d:¥lodloymalmoelo;

ROOOOIONE BOEMALISN@®S 213-00 @RMB2J30 (2)-00 &U6MWo (ag)) Daleemu
@I®000  (@E@MO® &303IMmMMSla) 2021 ©aVaiQoenid 2-00 G  (@I06eNIEl|O
LMDV O}@AM@IMIL0;

E@o®  eadallmmdadleel  alQINGWd  MleImBemOd®ICleaim  alddHo
6QIaHNEERUD DEMZOBIOAMM TIMILI0;

608 MOMNIM MIWATVE TVEMASMOTILIEOOM@IMILI0 @IM VMO MSals]
a)S}CHOMD® G@YQIUDIMIBIIM MaNal0IEBRUd Mlelaileneemzay 608 NQIBENAHS)
@6NI0RLIMIDIBlBNM BIMILI0;

DG 008, BRMIMIM, BIOOOTIONG BOeMALISMOS 213-00 @PMYBgJ30 (1)-00
QUEMWEI®I00  M@DHe]s  @oWlB006300  alldle@oula] 608  wWaIdeHAE
069 |0 BAUIMMMY Qil8oeNnIoey |SIomINL—

1. 2O}HOEa|0lo (01000BAI0.—(1) 0D &30l 2021-601 GHOS DY,

$0350188], ®¢ 6®o¥1e108] @MW (6B BoBUIMMMY ag)m Gald alOJo.

(2) o® 2020 =meeRl 300 OO (@O  AUM®I
B O}ME|ESEBMOIEN.

2. 1998-0e1 17-00 @QB:Q MIGBLSLIBHNIV] ERENMI_6).21Q)6)0 |ESENEBGIENT).—EDD
&edSlmmmy dlelaileldlesimm @oeio 1998-6e1 6HO8 0D, ©053QU8Sl, OF
omaslengl eouadilwl  @egla) (1998-ee1 17) (D®IMEUDaHO @EIWIM GYBQ
ag)aMI6N) 2 100DAUTIBO§|S)d) 3-00 Qo |l 10008UBlajldlenmm 6EENGI &UdHe)
ailew@mo@] @ Ioenielmienzoldlaanam@oem).

Thisisadigitaly signed Gazette.
Authenticity may be verified through https.//compose.kerala.gov.in/




3. 4-00 Qlé)a MBS EBRNTI.—(EIWIM BYB:FleRI 4-00 Qlds)q l@d,—

(1) (1)-00 QalQida @ “@ITINOTVo @S ©)atd QllMo” ag)M QUL BUDH6)
ald0o “I@I@0MVo al®lmeral 03ald Afl®mo” ag)aM QIBNGUD GalBELSENMB®IEN;

(2)  (2)-00 DalQIdfl@ “60600 MOTVARS a@¥ ©al” o) QUOHE)BUDHE)
ald0o “69600 MMV al®IME®T OJal” a0 QAUIIBENGUD CalBCHENZ®IEN);

(3) (3)-00 9alIB)a{l@d “630600 MOV o@S ot Qfl@Mo” ag)M QUL BUDH6)
ald0o “630600 MOV al®IMer®T ®Yat AflMo” ag)aM QUDBNGUD CalBELSENBDI6N);

(4) (-9 9al0IB}{lBd  “@RoIRIVETIT @EIMOW BB} @YD"  ag)
QIOBNGUBHE) aldh®o “BoUIBRIVOMING af)9alOBlera] LOMAIMOMIM @MLINIW
OS> af)(M QAUIHNBHUD BalBCHNENBDMIG).

4. 0398010 8$101086e130—(1) 2021-6081 GHO8 MY, B0QUSS], O H®IYIRINS]

eaHaMIWl (6cRVDI) s3odaWlMmmMM (2021-6e1 75) @M@ 0oL dlesaiam;.

(2) @RErReOM 0GIESIDVOMITBOMOM®@YH, (EINO® BIAAWINMAY (@ I8000
6ERNT  ©aIQer]s  IWOM  ERBIMBHIFID  HADDMEMO 2D ®IV
HSHO}MES)MMEMO @YW  oBOOIEo  BIOGAD  2f)SIOMEMO  af)SIOM@IV]
B0}MS}MEMI AW aBO@ B0 MSalSIE@I, D BBAIMIMY (@ 18000 GRRWM)
0219603 (@1WOm @BQladsl$l@d 6) 21D OICWI 2)S}ODMD@ICI
& 0YO6)|ESEIBMIE).

@Olal MaOMAE 6000,
DQICPE.

Thisisadigitaly signed Gazette.
Authenticity may be verified through https.//compose.kerala.gov.in/




GOVERNMENT OF KERALA
Law (Legislation-C) Department

NOTIFICATION

No. 9559/Leg. C2/2020/Law. Dated, Thiruvananthapuram, 24th August, 2021

8th Chingam, 1197
2nd Bhadra, 1943.

In pursuance of clause (3) of Article 348 of the Constitution of India, the Governor of
Kerala is pleased to authorise the publication in the Gazette of the following translation in
English language of the Kerala Bamboo, Kattuvalli and Pandanus Leaf Workers’ Welfare Fund
(Amendment) Ordinance, 2021 (129 of 2021).

By order of the Governor,

V. HARI NAIR,
Law Secretary.

Thisisadigitaly signed Gazette.
Authenticity may be verified through https.//compose.kerala.gov.in/




[Translation in English of “2021-ee1 6808 0Q, 050188l @¢ emIslens]
eaHamIW] (6cEL®I) BadIMadMY” published under the authority of the Governor.]

ORDINANCE No. 129 OF 2021

THE KERALA BAMBOO, KATTUVALLI AND PANDANUS LEAF WORKERS’
WELFARE FUND (AMENDMENT) ORDINANCE, 2021

Promulgated by the Governor of Kerala in the Seventy-second Year of the Republic of
India.

AN

ORDINANCE

to amend the Kerala Bamboo, Kattuvalli and Pandanus Leaf Workers’ Welfare Fund Act, 1998.

Preamble.—WHEREAS, the Kerala Bamboo, Kattuvalli and Pandanus Leaf Workers’
Welfare Fund (Amendment) Ordinance, 2020 (37 of 2020) was promulgated by the Governor
of Kerala on the 3rd day of July, 2020;

AND WHEREAS, a Bill to replace the said Ordinance by an Act of the State Legislature
could not be introduced in, and passed by, the Legislative Assembly of the State of Kerala
during its session which convened on the 24th day of August, 2020;

AND WHEREAS, in order to keep alive the provisions of the said Ordinance, the Kerala
Bamboo, Kattuvalli and Pandanus Leaf Workers’ Welfare Fund (Amendment) Ordinance, 2020
(65 0f 2020) was promulgated by the Governor of Kerala on the 26th day of September, 2020;

AND WHEREAS, a Bill to replace the said Ordinance by an Act of the State Legislature
could not be introduced in, and passed by, the Legislative Assembly of the State of Kerala,
during its session which convened on the 31st day of December, 2020 and during its session
which commenced on the 8th day of January, 2021 and ended on the 22nd day of January,
2021;

Thisisadigitaly signed Gazette.
Authenticity may be verified through https.//compose.kerala.gov.in/




AND WHEREAS, in order to keep alive the provisions of the said Ordinance, the Kerala
Bamboo, Kattuvalli and Pandanus Leaf Workers’ Welfare Fund (Amendment) Ordinance, 2021
(16 of 2021) was promulgated by the Governor of Kerala on the 9th day of February, 2021;

AND WHEREAS, a Bill to replace the said Ordinance by an Act of the State Legislature
could not be introduced in, and passed by, the Legislative Assembly of the State of Kerala,
during its session which commenced on the 24th day of May, 2021 and ended on the 10th day
of June, 2021;

AND WHEREAS, in order to keep alive the provisions of the said Ordinance, the Kerala
Bamboo, Kattuvalli and Pandanus Leaf Workers” Welfare Fund (Amendment) Ordinance,

2021 (75 of 2021) was promulgated by the Governor of Kerala on the 1st day of July, 2021;

AND WHEREAS, a Bill to replace the said Ordinance by an Act of the State Legislature
could not be introduced in, and passed by, the Legislative Assembly of the State of Kerala,
during its session which commenced on the 22nd day of July, 2021 and ended on the 13th day
of August, 2021;

AND WHEREAS, under sub-clause (a) of clause (2) of Article 213 of the Constitution of

India the said Ordinance will cease to operate on the 2nd day of September, 2021;

AND WHEREAS, difficulties will arise if the provisions of the said Ordinance are not kept

alive;

AND WHEREAS, the Legislative Assembly of the State of Kerala is not in session and the
Governor of Kerala is satisfied that circumstances exist which render it necessary for him to

take immediate action;

Now, THEREFORE, in exercise of the powers conferred by clause (1) of Article 213 of the
Constitution of India, the Governor of Kerala is pleased to promulgate the following

Ordinance:—

1. Short title and commencement.—(1) This Ordinance may be called the Kerala

Bamboo, Kattuvalli and Pandanus Leaf Workers’ Welfare Fund(Amendment) Ordinance, 2021.

(2) It shall be deemed to have come into force on the 3rd day of July, 2020.

Thisisadigitaly signed Gazette.
Authenticity may be verified through https.//compose.kerala.gov.in/




2. Act 17 of 1998 to be temporarily amended.—During the period of operation of this
Ordinance, the Kerala Bamboo, Kattuvalli and Pandanus Leaf Workers’ Welfare Fund Act,
1998 (17 of 1998) (hereinafter referred to as the principal Act) shall have effect subject to the

amendments specified in section 3.
3. Amendment of section 4.—In the principal Act, in section 4,—

(1) in sub-section (1), for the words “seven rupees each per month”, the words

“fifteen rupees each per month” shall be substituted;

(2) in sub-section (2), for the words “seven rupees per month”, the words “fifteen

rupees per month” shall be substituted;

(3) in sub-section (3), for the words “seven rupees each per month”, the words

“fifteen rupees each per month” shall be substituted;

(4) in sub-section (4), for the words “an amount equal to the amount contributed”,
the words “an amount equal to the seventy five percentage of the amount contributed” shall be

substituted.

4. Repeal and saving.—(1) The Kerala Bamboo, Kattuvalli and Pandanus Leaf Workers’
Welfare Fund(Amendment) Ordinance, 2021 (75 of 2021) is hereby repealed.

(2) Notwithstanding such repeal, anything done or deemed to have been done or any
action taken or deemed to have been taken under the principal Act as amended by the said
Ordinance shall be deemed to have been done or taken under the principal Act, as amended by

this Ordinance.

ARIF MOHAMMED KHAN,
GOVERNOR.

PUBLISHED BY THE SUPERINTENDENT OF GOVERNMENT PRESSES

AT THE GOVERNMENT CENTRAL PRESS, THIRUVANANTHAPURAM, 202 ki Digitally signed by Salim A
Thisisadigitally signed Gazette. Date:2021.08.25 05:38:28 +05:30

Authenticity may be verified through https.//compose.kerala.gov.in/




		2021-08-25T17:39:28+0530
	Salim A




